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From the Editor 

Famous People 
For a time I lived in Southern 

California. Periodically I would tele­
phone totalk to my family inPennsyl­
vania and my mother would occa­
sionally ask ifl had met any "famous 
people." She was referring, of course, 
to movie stars, professional athletes 
and other such celebrities. My answer 
was al ways no, since I had never had 
that kind of experience in California. 

Some time later, though, I reflected 
on these conversations, and it oc­
curred to me that "famous people" 
aren't always celebrities. In fact, I 
found that there were "famous people" 
all around me, and perhaps you '11 
indulge me while I attempt to explain. 

Most ofus have role models in life 
- people who demonstrate wealth, 
success, or some quality or character­
istic that we admire and would like to 
have in ourselves. I'd dare say that 
most of these role models are "fa­
mous people" such as the celebrities 
alluded to above. There is nothing 
wrong with this and I too have had 
these kinds of role models at one time 
or another. But many of my role 
models come from people I see every 
day. And some role models come in 
the form of other living creatures or 
things that exist in Nature. 

Now, I do not have a desire to be an 
animal, but I learned a lot from my 
recently departed pet Elkhound. His 
gentle nature was such that he never 
once in his 14 year life span did harm 
to another living creature. His ability 
to remain kind and gentle in a some­
times vicious world was most im­
pressive to me. 

Nor do I wish to be a tree, but I 
sometimes wish I had the flexibility 
of a birch tree. These amazing ere-
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ations bend a great deal but rarely 
break, in spite of the harsh elements 
that sometimes harass them. 

But my best role models come 
from my students and my patients. In 
my current position, Icome in contact 
each day with students of osteopathic 
medicine. These brave souls have 
taken on the long, hard road to be­
coming osteopathic physicians. Their 
enthusiasm, dedication and persever­
ance continuously stimulate me to 
stay as sharp as I can both academi­
cally and clinically. 

And my patients present a never 
ending source of role models. These 
are people from all walks oflife who 
demonstrate numerous qualities that 
I appreciate and admire. I think about 
these people in many ways. For ex­
ample when I treat a child, I often 
wonder: who is this person? Is this the 
next president of the United States? 
Or will he or she grow up to be an 
osteopathic physician? How will our 
interaction today influence the both 
of us? I hope that I can always have 
half the good qualities some of these 
people have. 

Who are your role models? The 
next time you look, you could go to 
the movies or to the ball park. But as 
for me, I'm going to the office to find 
some "famous people." 

"I always knew I wanted to be 
somebody. I just should have 

~ J J) ,u/JA / ~be-en_m_o_re_spe-cifi-c._" ___ _. l°t'tL / . _ J..n.,-U./f // v _ - Lily Tomlin 

Raymond J. Hruby DO, FAAO 
Deadline For Articles 

July 20 ..... ........... Fall Issue 
October 20 .......... Winter Issue 
January 20 .......... Spring Issue 
April 20 .............. Summer Issue 
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Instructions for Authors 
The American Academy of Oste­

opathy (AAO) Journal is intended as 
a forum for disseminating informa­
tion on the science and art of osteo­
pathic manipulative medicine. It is 
directed toward osteopathic physi­
cians, students, interns and residents, 
and particularly toward those physi­
cians with a special interest in osteo­
pathic manipulative treatment. 

The AAO Journal welcomes con­
tributions in the following categories: 

Original Contributions 
Clinical or applied research, or basic 
science research related to clinical 
practice. 

Case Reports 
Unusual clinical presentations, 
newly recognized situations, or 
rarely reported features. 

Clinical Practice 
Articles about practical applications 
for general practitioners or specialists. 

Special Communications 
Items related to the art of practice, 
such as poems, essays and stories. 

Letters to the Editor 
Comments on articles published in 
TheAAOJournalornewinfonnation 
on clinical topics. 

Professional News 
News of promotions, awards, ap­
pointments and other similar profes­
sional activities. 

Book Reviews 
Reviews of publications related to 
osteopathic manipulative medicine 
and to manipulative medicine in gen­
eral. 

Note: Contributions are accepted from 
members of the AOA, faculty mem­
bers in osteopathic medical colleges, 
osteopathic residents and interns and 
students of osteopathic colleges. 

A AAO Journal 

Contributions by others are accepted 
on an individual basis. 

Submission 
Submit all papers to Raymond J. 
Hruby, DO, FAAO, Editor-in-Chief, 
University of New England, 11 Hills 
Beach Road, Biddeford, ME 04005. 

Editorial Review 
Papers submitted to The AAO 

Journal may be submitted for review 
by the Editorial Board. Notification 
of acceptance or rejection usually is 
given within three months after re­
ceipt of the paper; publication fol­
lows as soon as possible thereafter, 
depending upon the backlog of pa­
pers. Some papers may be rejected 
because of duplication of subject 
matter or the need to establish priori­
ties on the use oflimited space. 

Requirements for manuscript sub­
mission: 

Manuscript 
1. Type all text, references and tabu­
lar material using upper and lower 
case, double-spaced with one-inch 
margins. Number all pages consecu­
tively. 
2. Submit original plus one copy. 
Please retain one copy for your files. 
3. Check that all references, tables 
and figures are cited in the text and in 
numerical order. 
4. Include a cover letter that gives 
the author's full name and address, 
telephone number, institution from 
which work initiated, and academic 
title or position. 

Computer Disks 
We encourage and welcome com­
puter disks containing the material 
submitted in hard copy form. Though 
we prefer MacIntosh 3-1/2" disks, 
MS-DOS formats using either 3-1/2" 
or 5-1/4" discs are equally acceptable. 

Illustrations 
1. Be sure that illustrations submit-
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ted are clearly labeled. 
2. Photos should be submitted as 5" x 
7" glossy black and white prints with 
high contrast. On the back of each, 
clearly indicate the top of the photo. 
Use a photocopy to indicate the 
placement of arrows and other mark­
ers on the photos. If color is necessary, 
submit clearly labeled 35 mm slides 
with the tops marked on the frames. 
All illustrations will be returned to 
the authors of published manuscripts. 
3. Include a caption for each figure. 

Permissions 
Obtain written permission from the 
publisher and author to use previ­
ously published illustrations and sub­
mit these letters with the manuscript. 
You also must obtain written permis­
sion from patients to use their photos 
if there is a possibility that they might 
be identified. In the case of children, 
permission must be obtained from a 
parent or guardian. 

References 
1. References are required for all 
material derived from the work of 
others. Cite all references in numeri­
cal order in the text. If there are refer­
ences used as general source mate­
rial, but from which no specificinfor­
mation was taken, list them in alpha­
betical order following the numbered 
journals. 
2. For journals, include the names of 
all authors, complete title of the ar­
ticle, name of the journal, volume 
number, date and inclusive page 
numbers. For books, include the 
name(s) of the editor(s), name and 
location of publisher and year of pub­
lication. Give page numbers for exact 
quotations. 

Editorial Processing 
All accepted articles are subject to 

copy editing. Authors are responsible 
for all statements, including changes 
made by the manuscript editor. No 
material may be reprinted from The 
AAO Journal without the written per­
mission of the editor and theauthor(s). 
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An Integrated Approach for 
Treating the OB Patient: Treating the 

Five Diaphrams of the Body, Part I 

Introduction 
regnant 
women are a 
joy to treat. 
They seem to 
be tied di­
rectly into the 
primary life 
force of the 

universe. Pregnancy is a time of 

change; anatomically, physically, 

mentally and emotionally. Part I of 

this paper will discuss the physiologi­

cal as well as anatomical changes that 

occur during pregnancy. Part 2 will 

discuss diagnosis and use treating the 

five" diaphragms of the body (the foot 

arches, the pelvis, the respiratory dia­

phragm, Sibson 's fascia covering the 

thoracic inlet and the tentorium cer­

ebelli) as a model for treatment. 

PHYSIOLOGY 
Cardiovascular System 

The blood volume increases by 

approximately 40-55%. There are in­

creases in stroke volume by 30%, 

heart rate by 10-20% and possibly an 

increase in the cardiac volume by 

10%. The changes in the cardiovas­

cular system indicate that there is 

more blood for the cardiovascular 

system to circulate. 
There are numerous vascular 

changes that occur as well. The uter­

ine blood flow changes from approxi­

mately 30-50 ml up to 500-1000 ml 

per minute. There is also an increase 

in the breast blood flow. 

Respiratory System 
It has been proposed that the respi-

/A. MOJournal 

by Ken Johnson, DO 

ratory rate is unchanged. The tidal 

volume increases by 40% and the 

residual volume (which is the volume 

aftermaximum exhalation) decreases 

by 20%. The expiratory reserve vol­

ume (the amount that can be expired 

at the end of normal exhalation) in­

creases by 20% and the functional 

residual capacity decreases. The tho­

racic cage also flares, increasing the 

subcostal angle from 68° to 103°. The 

diaphragm, due to the changes of 

pregnancy, must increase in its excur­

sion to oxygenate the increased blood 

volume. 
A common complaint of preg­

nancy is a subjective feeling of dys­

pnea. Dyspnea is possibly due to the 

increase in blood volume to be oxy­

genated, and the anatomic changes 

which lead to altered respiratory 

function. 

Renal System 
Because there is more blood to be 

circulated by the cardiovascular sys­

tem, there is more blood to purify. 

Therefore, the glomerular filtration 

rate increases by approximately 50% 

with a corresponding increase in so­

dium retention. 

Endocrine System 
The corpus luteum of pregnancy 

produces a polypeptide hormone 

called "relaxin". Also, there is an 

increase in the production of estro­

gen. These hormonal changes cause 

relaxation of the pelvic ligaments and 

also a general relaxation of many 

ligaments throughout the body. 

These endocrine changes are 

6 

helpful and detrimental from a struc­

tural point of view. Women who have 

pre-existing somatic dysfunction be­

fore pregnancy may be helped greatly 

during pregnancy. The relaxation of 

the ligaments allows for a greater, as 

well as easier, mobilization of a re­

stricted joint. There is also a negative 

effect in that the relaxation of the 

ligaments can promote somatic dys­

function occurring at a joint; a com­

mon example is an acute pubic sym­

physis shear. This can be an excruci­

atingly painful somatic dysfunction. 

ANATOMY 
There are many anatomical 

changes that occur during pregnancy. 

The growing fetus within the uterus 

causes an overall anterior shift in the 

center of gravity of the pregnant 

woman with a compensatory poste­

rior shift in the shoulders - the so­

called "pride of pregnancy stance". 

There is an increase in the lumbar 

lordosis. These shifts cause changes 

in the thoracoabdominal pelvic cavi­

ties which impede function and will 

be discussed in the following sec­

tions. 

First Diaphragm -
Arches of the Feet 

The na vicular bone is like the key­

stone of the medial arch. With the 

postural changes that occur during 

pregnancy, it is common to find a 

functional pes planus or "flatfoot". 

The arch, especially the navicular 

bone, drops inferiorly. There is a 

change in the relationship of the talus 
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to the tibia and fibula, which will 
change the orientation of the knee 
joint and, in return, will be reflected 
into the pelvis. 

The tibialis anterior attaches to the 
medial cuneiform and base of the first 
metatarsal. The tibialis posterior at­
taches to the navicular, cuneiforms, 
cuboids and bases of2--4 metatarsals. 
Together these muscles form a sling 
for the longitudinal arch. As the arch 
drops, there is an increased tone and 
tension noticed in the tibialis muscles. 

The tibialis anterior attaches on 
the lateral anterior portion of the tibia 
and the approximate region where the 
iliotibial band attaches. When the arch 
drops, there is a change in the ten­
sions of the tibialis anterior, reflect­
ing into the iliotibial band which, in 
tum, will affect the pelvis. As the arch 
drops, the talus changes the relation­
ship with the tibia and the fibula; the 
fibula being an attachment for the 
long and short head of the biceps. 
Therefore, the change in orientation 
of the fibula and tibia will have an 
effect on the long and short head of 
the biceps. The biceps femoris attaches 
from the fibula head to the ischial 
tuberosity as well as the sacrotuber­
ous ligaments. 

These changes in the anatomical 
relationships of the arches (first dia­
phragm) to the second diaphragm (the 
pelvic diaphragm) of the body can be 
enough to impede both the postural as 
well as respiratory motion of the pel­
vis and lower extremity. 

Second Diaphragm -
Pelvic Diaphragm 

The pelvis is made up of the two 
innominates and the sacrum. It is 
heavily invested with muscle and 
neurovascular structures, as well as 
fascia! structures. The endopelvic 
fascia attaches anterior to posterior, 
as well as medial lateral, forming 
what could be thought of as support 
bridges for the pelvic organs; namely 
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the uterus, bladder and rectum. The 
bladder is suspended in the pelvis by 
the median umbilical ligament (em­
bryonic remnant of the urachus) as 
well as its lateral and posterior at -
tachments of endopelvic fascia. The 
cardinal ligaments containing the 
uterine artery forms a lateral suspen­
sion for the uterus. There is a direct 
connection between the bladder and 
the uterus, running anterior to poste­
rior, forming the vesicouterine pouch. 
The bladder is also suspended by the 
lateral pubovesicular ligaments. The 
rectum is suspended by the presacral 
fascia as well as the vaginal rectal 
fascia. 

The fascia of the pelvis and the 
endopelvic fascia basically suspends 
these three organs - the bladder, uterus 
and rectum within the pelvic cavity, 
allowing them to float within the 
contentofthepelviccavity. Thenames 
of the fascial ligaments are somewhat 
misleading, creating the idea that there 
are a number of separate ligaments 
within the pelvis. In reality, the liga­
ments are thickenings of fascia, which 
are continuous with each other and 
withthefasciasoftherestofthe body. 

Any kind of twist in the pelvis, any 
restriction in the pubic symphysis or 
either sacroiliac joint can have a large 
effect on the endopelvic organs. A 
twist within the pelvis will impede 
the organs and the vessels leading to 
a stasis of fluid in the pelvic organs as 
well as the lower extremity. One pro­
posed mechanism of swelling in the 
lower extremities is that the fetus will 
impinge on the inferior vena cava 
somewhat and cause a back pressure 
within the venous system, leading to 
venous stasis. Another possible 
mechanism is somatic dysfunction of 
the pelvis, impairing the ability of the 
pelvic diaphragm to move in con­
junction with the respiratory dia­
phragm leading to stasis oflymphatic 
and venous fluid. 
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Third Diaphragm -
Respiratory Diaphragm 

The pelvic and the respiratory dia­
phragms are connected anteriorly, 
posteriorly, radially and laterally. 
Posteriorly, the quadratus lumborum 
is attached to the lumbar vertebrae 
and the iliac crest. Superiorly, the 
quadratus lumborum is attached to 
the twelfth rib. The quadratus lum­
borum could be viewed as a functional 
extension of the diaphragm. The 
quadratus lumborum has, as its action, 
both postural as well as respiratory 
motion Thequadratuslumborumacts 
as an anchor for the twelfth rib during 
respiration. Restriction in either he­
midiaphragm can be seen reflected in 
the quadratus lumborum and through 
the tensorfascialata into the iliotibial 
band all the way to the peroneal 
muscles of the lower extremity. 

POSTERIOR 
The diaphragm is attached to the 

twelfth rib posteriorly via the lateral 
and medial arcuate ligaments. The 
lateral arcuate ligament attaches from 
the twelfth rib to the transverse pro­
cess ofT12. Themedialarcuateliga­
ment attaches from the transverse 
process of Tl2 to the body and the 
anterior longitudinal ligament at Tl2. 
The medial and lateral arcuate liga­
ments form what could be thought of 
as caves for the quadratus lumborum 
and the psoas. These ligaments are 
basically thickenings of the fascia, 
covering the muscles in this region. 

Medially, the crura of the dia­
phragm attaches to Ll, 2 and 3 on the 
right and Ll and 2 on the left. This is 
how it is described in most anatomy 
books. In reality the crura attaches to 
the anterior longitudinal ligament and 
blends to this ligament. !tis impossible 
to separate the crura from the anterior 
longitudinal ligament at their attach­
ments. Looking at specimens in the 
anatomy lab, the crura basically blend 
into the anterior longitudinal ligament 
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and functionally become a portion of 

it. The anterior longitudinal ligament 

continues down through the lumbar 

vertebrae and can be shown to con­

tinue into the anterior sacral coccygeal 

ligaments and then directly into the 

pelvic musculature, thus forming the 

posterior connection between the 

pelvic and respiratory diaphragms. 

The lateral connection between the 

pelvic and respiratory diaphragm are 

through the muscles of the abdominal 

wall. 

ANTERIOR 
The organs and muscles of the 

pelvic cavity connect with the en­

dopelvic fascia. The endopelvic fas­

cia is connected to the median umbili­

cal ligament and to the medial umbili­

cal ligaments which go to the umbi­

licus andlinea albaofthe rectus sheath. 

Continuing superiorly from the um­

bilicus, the falciform ligament and 

ligamentum teres (round ligament) 

attach to the liver as well as the inferior 

surface of the diaphragm. Therefore, 

there is a direct anterior connection 

from the pelvic diaphragm to the 

respiratory diaphragm. The falciform 

ligament basically cuts the liver in 

half anterior to posterior. 
The combination of the falciform 

ligament with the ligamentum teres 

(round ligament) embedded within it 

and the ligamentum venosum form 

an anterior to posterior fascia! con­

nection. So there is not only an infe­

rior to superior connection from the 

pelvic diaphragm to the respiratory 

diaphragm, but there is also an ante­

rior to posterior connection of the 

anterior abdominal wall to the poste­

rior abdominal wall under the dia­

phragm. 
The diaphragm interdigitates with 

the transversus abdominus at a 90° 

angle. This relationship with the 

transversus abdominus blending into 

the linea alba medially can be useful 

in treattnent 
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Reciprocal Function of the 

Respiratory and Pelvic Diaphragm 

(There is a functional relationship 

between the pelvic diaphragm through 

the median umbilical ligament to the 

umbilicus and thenthefalciformliga­

ment through to the diaphragm.) The 

pelvic diaphragm works in a recipro­

cal relationship with the respiratory 

diaphragm. As the respiratory dia­

phragm contracts, the pelvic dia­

phragm must relax to allow the ab­

dominal and pelvic contents to shift 

inferior! y. If there is any restriction in 

the respiratory or pelvic diaphragms, 

this physiological phenomenon will 

not occur. It may be that there are 

neuronal pathways which reflexively 

relax the pelvic diaphragm when the 

respiratory diaphragm contracts and 

vice versa. 
With each inspiration, the dia­

phragm acts on the lumbar vertebrae. 

There is a general flattening of all 

spinal A-P curves. The diaphragm, 

acting through the crura moves the 

anterior longitudinal ligament and has 

a far reaching effect throughout the 

cardiovascular system. Blood is 

pumped from the heart out to the 

extremities throughout the cardio­

vascular system. Blood is returned 

through the venous and lymphatic 

channels by the action of the pumping 

of the peripheral muscles. The return 

system (venous and lymphatic) is 

highly pressure-gradient dependent. 

When the return of blood enters the 

pelvic cavity and abdominal cavities, 

it is solely dependent on the pressure 

differentials between the thorax, ab­

dominal and pelvic cavities. The lym­

phatic system returns 10% of the cir­

culatory fluid from the periphery with 

each cycle. It has been estimated that 

in a 24-hour period, we tum over 

100% of the circulating serum blood 

volume through the lymphatic sys­

tem. The peripheral muscles act to 

pump the lymphatic fluid into the 

lymphatic channels and back cen­

trally. Any disturbance in the thora-
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coabdominopelvic cylinder will im­

pede the return of fluid centrally. 

The growing fetus will displace 

the abdominal contents superiorly, 

pushing the diaphragm into the tho­

racic cavity. Affectively, there is a 

decrease in the superior to inferior 

length of the thoracic cavity. There­

fore, the diaphragm must work at an 

increased rate of contraction against a 

stronger resistance to maintain oxy­

genation of the circulating blood vol­

ume. 
Not only is there an effect on the 

superior to inferior length of the tho­

racic cavity, the growing fetus shift­

ing the center of gravity anteriorly 

willincreasethelumbarlordosis. This 

creates a largertension on the crura of 

the diaphragm posteriorly, impeding 

diaphragmatic function. The pelvis is 

tilted anteriorly, greater tension is 

placed on the anterior abdominal wall 

and the thoraxes A-P diameter is de­

creased. 

Fourth Diaphragm -
Sibson's Fascia 

The thoracic inlet, which is com­

prised of Tl, the first ribs and manu­

brium, work as a functional unit. Any 

rotation of Tl will be reflected through 

the first ribs and the manubrium, 

changing the diameterof the superior 

thoracic aperture. Sibson's fascia is 

attached to the inferior border of the 

first ribs and the posterior border of 

the manubrium and going posteriori y 

to the region of the seventh cervical 

and the first thoracic vertebrae. It has 

imbedded within it the scalenus mini­

mus which when contracted, tenses 

Sibson's fascia. This fascia acts as a 

diaphragm covering the cupula of the 

lung. Sibson's fascia is also respon­

sible for maintaining a pressure gra­

dient between the neck and the tho­

rax. Without this gradient, the neck 

viscera would be sucked into the tho­

rax with each inspiration. 

The fascial connection of the peri-
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and functionally become a portion of Reciprocal Function of the coabdominopelvic cylinder will im- cardium to the sternum is called the nected to the Sibson's fascia through the pelvic diaphragm and Sibson's 
it. The anterior longitudinal ligament Respiratory and Pelvic Diaphragm pede the return of fluid centrally. "pericardia! ligament".The pericar- the prevertebral as well as pretrachael fascia work together to create pres-
continues down through the lumbar (There is a functional relationship The growing fetus will displace dium is basically pretracheal fascia, fascias. The pretracheal and preverte- sure differentials which promote cir-
vertebrae and can be shown to con- between the pelvic diaphragm through the abdominal contents superiorly, which has extended down from the bra! fascias as cylinders extending culation of venous and lymphatic 
tinue into the anterior sacral coccygeal the median umbilical ligament to the pushing the diaphragm into the tho- neck and embedded itself into the from the thorax into the neck region. fluid. As the respiratory diaphragm 
ligaments and then directly into the umbilicus and then thefalciformliga- racic cavity. Affectively, there is a diaphragm. This pretracheal fascia The prevertebral fascia invests the contracts, the pelvic diaphragm re-
pelvic musculature, thus forming the ment through to the diaphragm.) The decrease in the superior to inferior continues from the diaphragm being ribs. It continues from 1st ribs superi- laxes, allowing the contents to drop 
posterior connection between the pelvic diaphragm works in a recipro- length of the thoracic cavity. There- the covering of the heart, connecting orly to cover the bodies of the verte- into the pelvic cavity. A relative 
pelvic and respiratory diaphragms. cal relationship with the respiratory fore, the diaphragm must work at an to the sternum and into the neck. The brae as well as the anterior and poste- negative pressure is established in the 
The lateral connection between the diaphragm. As the respiratory dia- increased rate of contraction against a ribs are covered by the prevertebral rior cervical vertebral muscles. This thorax with positive pressure in the 
pelvic and respiratory diaphragm are phragm contracts, the pelvic dia- stronger resistance to maintain oxy- fascia, which travels superiorly to the column of fascia is a direct connec- abdomen and pelvis. On exhalation, 
through the muscles of the abdominal phragm must relax to allow the ab- genationofthe circulating blood vol- base of the skull. tion between the first ribs, the manu- the respiratory diaphragm rises by 
wall. dominal and pelvic contents to shift ume. Just as there is a relationship be- brium and T 1, to the base of the skull. elastic recoil and pressure gradients 

inferior! y. If there is any restriction in Not only is there an effect on the tween the thoracic and pelvic dia- The insertion of the muscles of the reverse. 

ANTERIOR the respiratory or pelvic diaphragms, superior to inferior length of the tho- phragms with respiration, Sibson's neck onto the skull, effectively con- The tentorium cerebelli and pelvic 

The organs and muscles of the this physiological phenomenon will racic cavity, the growing fetus shift- fascia acts as a diaphragm in a recip- necting Sibson's fascia to the skull. diaphragm work in synchrony as well. 

pelvic cavity connect with the en- not occur. It may be that there are ing the center of gravity anteriorly rocal relationship with the thoracic The tentorium cerebelli, being re- As the primary respiratory mecha-

dopelvic fascia. The endopelvic fas- neuronal pathways which reflexively willincreasethelumbarlordosis. This diaphragm. Any distortion of the tho- flections of dura, is directly connected nism goes into its flexion phase, the 

cia is connected to the median umbili- relax the pelvic diaphragm when the creates a larger tension on the crura of racic inlet will lead to passive conges- through the foramen magnum to the tentorium moves inferiorly, the sa-

cal ligament and to the medial umbili- respiratory diaphragm contracts and the diaphragm posteriorly, impeding tion of venous and lymphatic fluids spinal dura to C2 and C3 and then to era! base moves posterior with the 

cal ligaments which go to the umbi- vice versa. diaphragmatic function. The pelvis is throughout the whole body. The tho- the second sacral segment, forming a apex moving anterior. The innomi-

lieus andlinea alba of the rectus sheath. With each inspiration, the dia- tilted anteriorly, greater tension is racic inlet is approximately 4-1/2" continuous connection to the sacrum nates move into external rotation. The 

Continuing superiorly from the um- phragm acts on the lumbar vertebrae. placed on the anterior abdominal wall wide by about 2-1/2" long. Within (cranial to pelvic diaphragm). There reverse occurs in extension. There is 

bilicus, the falciform ligament and There is a general flattening of all and the thoraxes A-P diameter is de- this space is a great number of vital is evidence that the dura has firm a relationship of the primary respira-

ligamentum teres (round ligament) spinal A-P curves. The diaphragm, creased. structures. The thoracic duct empties attachments to most vertebrae tory mechanism ( cranial rhythmic 

attach to the liver as well as the inferior acting through the crura moves the into the left subclavian vein in the throughout the column as well. impulse) to the secondary respiratory 

surface of the diaphragm. Therefore, anterior longitudinal ligament and has 
Fourth Diaphragm - region of the thoracic inlet as well as The tentorium cerebelli has em- mechanism (breathing) in which they 

there is a direct anterior connection a far reaching effect throughout the Sib son's Fascia the right thoracic duct. The thoracic bedded within it the venous sinuses. tend to augment each other. 

from the pelvic diaphragm to the cardiovascular system. Blood is 
The thoracic inlet, which is com- duct drains most of the lymphatic (The root of venous drainage from the The arches have an effect on the 

respiratory diaphragm. The falciform pumped from the heart out to the prised of Tl, the first ribs and manu- fluids of the body minus the right skull is through the venous sinuses.) other diaphragms through their role 

ligament basically cuts the liver in extremities throughout the cardio- brium, work as a functional unit. Any portion of the thorax, the right head The tentorium cerebelli is attached to in posture. A functional pes planus 

half anterior to posterior. vascular system. Blood is returned 
rotationofTl will be reflected through and the right upper extremity. Any the petrous ridges of the temporal ( dropped arch) will restrict motion of 

The combination of the falciform through the venous and lymphatic 
the first ribs and the manubrium, distortion of the thoracic inlet will bone ( enclosing the superior petrosal the pelvis during respiratory and pos-

ligament with the ligamentum teres channels by the action of the pumping changing the diameter of the superior lead to passive congestion of venous sinus) and the internal surface of the tural motion, thus affecting the four 

(round ligament) embedded within it of the peripheral muscles. The return 
thoracic aperture. Sibson's fascia is and lymphatic fluids throughout the occiput. As the sphenobasilar junc- remaining diaphragms. How this is 

and the ligamentum venosum form system (venous and lymphatic) is 
attached to the inferior border of the whole body. tion goes into flexion, the ten tori um seen clinically will be discussed in 

an anterior to posterior fascia! con- highly pressure-gradient dependent. 
first ribs and the posterior border of There are a great number of struc- is brought inferior and spreads out. In Part 2. 

nection. So there is not only an infe- When the return of blood enters the 
themanubrium and going posteriorly tures that traverse the thoracic inlet extension, the opposite occurs. The The full functioning of the five 

rior to superior connection from the pelvic cavity and abdominal cavities, to the region of the seventh cervical besides the thoracic duct. These tentorium cerebelli aids in the circu- diaphragms must be maintained to 

pelvic diaphragm to the respiratory it is solely dependent on the pressure and the first thoracic vertebrae. It has sttuctures include the trachea, the lation of venous as well as cerebra- prevent symptoms of pain, passive 

diaphragm, but there is also an ante- differentials between the thorax, ab- imbedded within it the scalenus mini- esophagus, the vagus nerve, the sym- spinal fluid. The tentorium cerebelli congestion of fluid, dyspnea and oth-

rior to posterior connection of the dominal and pelvic cavities. Thelym- mus which when contracted, tenses pathetic chain ganglion, carotid arter- is part of the dural sttuctures that form ers. As described, the five diaphragms 

anterior abdominal wall to the poste- phatic system returns 10% of the cir-
Sibson's fascia. This fascia acts as a ies, subclavian arteries, and subcla- the "core link" connecting the sphe- are related to each other anatomically 

rior abdominal wall under the dia- culatory fluid from the periphery with 
diaphragm covering the cupula of the vian veins. The brachia! plexus rests nobasilar junction to the sacrum. The and therefore, functionally. 

phragm. each cycle. It has been estimated that lung. Sibson's fascia is also respon- on the superior borderof the first ribs. reciprocal function of both areas is The diagnosis and treatment of the 

The diaphragm interdigitates with in a 24-hour period, we tum over sible for maintaining a pressure gra- Based on these anatomical relation- important in maintaining health. obstetrical patient using these prin-

the transversus abdominus at a 90° 100% of the circulating serum blood dient between the neck and the tho- ships, this becomes a very important ciples will be discussed in Part 2 of 

angle. This relationship with the volume through the lymphatic sys- rax. Without this gradient, the neck area to examine. Function of The Five Diaphragms this series, which will be published in 

transversus abdominus blending into tern. The peripheral muscles act to viscera would be sucked into the tho- Together the Spring issue of this journal, along 

the linea alba medially can be useful pump the lymphatic fluid into the rax with each inspiration. Fifth Diaphragm - There is a synchronous motion of with the complete reference list for 

in treatment. lymphatic channels and back cen- The fascia! connection of the peri- Tentorium Cerebelli the five diaphragms of the body. As both articles. 
trally. Any disturbance in the thora-

The tentorium cerebelli is con- the respiratory diaphragm contracts, 
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Practice Management Tips 

Evaluation of 
Managed Care Contracting 

Rapid! y rising health care costs 

stimulated the development of alter­

native healthcare delivery systems. 

Managed care contracts were devel­

oped in the large urban areas and are 

now spreading into the lesser popu­

lated areas. Healthcare practices will 

need to consider the impact of par­

ticipating in these plans. This article 

will outline factors that figure in this 

decision. 

Financial Factors 
Increased patient volume is a ma­

jor selling point of managed care con­

tracts. Increased volume, even at 

discounted reimbursement rates can 

increase compensation. Fixed costs 

account for a large portion of practice 

operating costs. Costs such as rent, 

utilities, real estate taxes and others 

will not normally vary with changes 

in patient volume. Consider the fol­

lowing illustration about the cost of 

providing an office procedure: 

A AAO Journal 

by Tom H. Schnack, CPA 

Fixed costs (rent, utilities, etc.) $10 
Variable costs (medical 
supplies, nursing, etc.) .15. 
TOTAL $25 

In this example, reimbursement in 

excess of $15 actually generates in­

come to the practice. The practice has 
to consider whether the managed 
care patient is taking time that could 

be used by a more profitable patient. 

Bad debts are another consider­

ation. Managed care plans reimburse 
the physician directly. Patient re­

sponsibility is usually limited to a 

small amount eliminating most bad 

debts. 
Managed care contracts can re­

duce administrative cost of billing, 
collecting and posting charges. Capi­

tation plans do not require the prac­

tice to bill the patient. Fee-for-service 
plans information is received in a 

batch format allowing the practice to 
post charges and payments to the pa­

tients' accounts quickly reducing ad­

ministrative time. 

10 

Requirements of the plan may 
generate offsetting, administrative 

responsibilities. Make careful review 
of the plan's utilization review re­

quirements. Cost containment provi­

sions may be inconsistent with your 

standard of care. The plans may re­
quire involvement from higher levels 

of staffincluding the physicians. This 
time may more than offset the ben­

efits gained from any reduction in 

administrative costs. 
There may be additional costs from 

providing service to patients with 

lapsed benefits or furnishing non­

covered services. 
Careful consideration should be 

given to the financial condition of the 

plan. There are cases where a plan 

went bankrupt while the physicians 

were still responsible for care to the 

patients enrolled under that plan. 

Review the termination provisions 

of the plan. The contractual duties of 

the physician may extend past the 

termination date. Evaluate the plan 
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Practice Management Tips 

Evaluation of 
Managed Care Contracting 

Rapidly rising health care costs 
stimulated the development of alter­
native healthcare delivery systems. 
Managed care contracts were devel­
oped in the large urban areas and are 
now spreading into the lesser popu­
lated areas. Healthcare practices will 
need to consider the impact of par­
ticipating in these plans. This article 
will outline factors that figure in this 
decision . 

Financial Factors 
Increased patient volume is a ma­

jor selling point of managed care con­
tracts. Increased volume, even at 
discounted reimbursement rates can 
increase compensation. Fixed costs 
account for a large portion of practice 
operating costs. Costs such as rent, 
utilities, real estate taxes and others 
will not nonnally vary with changes 
in patient volume. Consider the fol­
lowing illustration about the cost of 
providing an office procedure: 

/4\.. AAO Journal 

by Tom H. Schnack, CPA 

Fixed costs (rent, utilities, etc.) $10 
Variable costs (medical 
supplies, nursing, etc.) ..15. 
TOTAL $25 

In this example, reimbursement in 
excess of $15 actually generates in­
come to the practice. The practice has 
to consider whether the managed 
care patient is taking time that could 
be used by a more profitable patient. 

Bad debts are another consider­
ation. Managed care plans reimburse 
the physician directly. Patient re­
sponsibility is usually limited to a 
small amount eliminating most bad 
debts. 

Managed care contracts can re­
duce administrative cost of billing, 
collecting and posting charges. Capi­
tation plans do not require the prac­
tice to bill the patient. Fee-for-service 
plans infonnation is received in a 
batch fonnat allowing the practice to 
post charges and payments to the pa­
tients' accounts quickly reducing ad­
ministrative time. 

Requirements of the plan may 
generate offsetting, administrative 
responsibilities. Make careful review 
of the plan's utilization review re­
quirements. Cost containment provi­
sions may be inconsistent with your 
standard of care. The plans may re­
quire involvement from higher levels 
of staff including the physicians. This 
time may more than offset the ben­
efits gained from any reduction in 
administrative costs. 

There may be additional costs from 
providing service to patients with 
lapsed benefits or furnishing non­
covered services. 

Careful consideration should be 
given to the financial condition of the 
plan. There are cases where a plan 
went bankrupt while the physicians 
were still responsible for care to the 
patients enrolled under that plan. 

Review the tennination provisions 
of the plan. The contractual duties of 
the physician may extend past the 
tennination date. Evaluate the plan 
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provisions for billing and payment. 
The plans may require additional in­
formation not readily available on 
your billing system. Payment may be 
conditioned on receipt of "required 
infmmation." 

Low cost sharing plans encourage 
the patient to see the healthcare pro­
fessional more often. Increased 
volume's impact on the practice can 
be positive or negative depending on 
the type of plan. Capitation plans 
would not provide increased benefits 
while fee-for-service would generate 
additional revenue. 

Payment Methods 
Payment methods basically fall 

under two groups. One group is the 
discounted fee-for-service plans and 
the other is capitated payment plans. 

Determine the mechanism for 
calculating the fee-for-service 
schedule. The two primary types are 
UCR and relative values. Review plan 
provisions for the commitment and 
mechanism for fee updates. Request 
access to the fee schedule before con­
tracting. Make sure the fees you re­
view represent the codes you will be 
billing. Compute the effective dis­
count by comparison of the fee 
schedule to your present reimburse­
ment. 

Review the deadlines for claims 
submission to the plan. Claims review 
and claims processing vary by plan 
operation. Request a list of physicians 
who can be called as references. Re­
view the plan and detennine what you 
are allowed to charge for. Plans may 
have a higher reimbursement for cer­
tain procedures but not allow you to 
charge for others. 

Typical primary care capitation/ 
risk payment plans provide a monthly 
payment to the practice. Payments 
are actuarially determined using cer­
tain age and sex factors for every 
member of the plan who designates 
that physician as their primary care 
gatekeeper. The capitation payments 

A AAO Journal 

cover a defined set of services pro­
vided by the primary care physician. 
The physician may or may not be 
permitted to provide services outside 
the capitation on a fee-for-service 
basis. The plans usually withhold 10-
20% ofthecapitationamountsto serve 
as a financial risk to the physician. 

All or a portion of this holdback is 
later reimbursed to the physician based 
on that physician's financial perfor­
mance. The plan provides a pool for 
payments to referring physicians, 
hospitals, ancillary services, etc. 
These amounts are called the referral 
and/or hospital risk pools. Payments 
made for the approved services are 
attributed to the assigned gatekeeper's 
pool. The gatekeepers manage and 
oversee the disbursement of funds 
from these pools. Except in emergen­
cies and out-of-area coverage, the 
primary care gatekeeper must give 
prior approval for referral services. 

Financially, the physician is typi­
cally at-risk for only the amount of 
the risk pool. However, the physician 
remains responsible for treatment after 
the risk pool is consumed. Additional 
time spent seeing the patient is loss of 
potential revenue. 

Evaluate the plan method to limit 
risk. The plan should provide stop­
loss provisions so any single patient 
cannot consume the risk pool. 

Consider the possibility of a fa­
vorable or adverse selection of plan 
participants. The plans assume a 
random selection, however, this may 
not always occur. Reputation of the 
physician or expertise in a particular 
area may alter the selection process. 
Plan procedures for referring patients 
who have not selected a gatekeeper 
also impact the process. 

Practice Issues 
The plan may restrict the physi­

cian referrals to designated physi­
cians and facilities. This alters the 
practice's usual referral patterns. 

11 

Review the list of contracting 
hospitals and physicians to deter­
mine your familiarity with their 
qualifications. Ascertain whether 
you have privileges at the contract­
ing hospitals. Also, does the plan 
provide an adequate network of 
physicians and facilities. 

The plans require the gatekeeper 
to exert a significant amount of con­
trol on the treatment of a patient 
altering the normal relationship. 
This includes approval of treatment 
and tests provided by specialists. 

With lower cost sharing, there is 
a higher likelihood of missed ap­
pointments. Consider whether the 
plan provides for missed appoint­
ment charges. 

Summary 
Physicians need to carefully 

analyze the advantages and disad­
vantages of participating in managed 
care plans. Evaluate whether the 
potential for increased patient vol­
ume offsets the administrative re­
quirements and the disruption of 
practice routines. The physicians 
need to consider the total impact of 
the plan before choosing to partici­
pate. 

Tom H. Schnack, CPA, is with the 
finn of Seim,Johnson, Sestakand Quist 
in Omaha, NE. 

Technological Gap 
Between Apple and IBM 

The recent computer summit be­
tween IBM and Apple yielded an 
agreement to share technology and 
make their systems more compatible. 
For physicians, this means that soft­
ware that previously ran only on IBM 
personal computers, may now be 
compatiblewithAPplecomputersand 
vice versa. One example is the pro­
gram DO Plus, a computer program 
developed for osteopathic physicians 
which was designed lo be run on an 
Apple personal computer, can now 
be used on an IBM. 

Winter 1991 



Cranial Osteopathy: 
A New Perspective 

by Andrew Ferguson, DO (Hons) MRO 

Summary: The theory of cranial os­
teopathy has not kept up with improv­
ing understanding in related areas. A 
viewpoint is put forward that begins 
to provide a remedy for that and also 
provides a foundation for progress 
towards a more comprehensive and 
holistic therapy. 
Key Words: Cranium, Bones, 
Sutures, Muscles, Whole body, Emo­

tions. 

Introduction 
Cranial ( or cranio-sacral osteopathy 

was developed fifty years ago by 

William Sutherland; 
1 

since that time 

it has made little academic progress. 

Clinical results have justified a prac­

tice based on inaccurate theory and 

the time has come not just for a step 

forward, but for a fundamental change 

of perspective. For osteopathy to de­

velop and continue its role as guiding 

the way to the next higher stage of 

medicine,
2 

we need to have an inte­

grated and evolving philosophy and 

theory based on secure foundations 

of anatomy and physiology. 

Historical Development 
Sutherland evolved his view at a 

time when osteopathy was a combi­

nation of the analysis of bone me­

chanics (thus the prefix 'osteo') and 

religious fervour: A. T. Still, the 

founder of osteopathy, was both a 

methodist minister and engineer as 

well as a physician. Sutherland ob­

served that the cranium was formed 

from many individual bones and spent 

many years analyzing their articular 

mechanics. This was indeed a great 

advance. Hefeltthatthe bones moved 

rhythmically and proposed a theory 
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to explain this which contained five 

essential elements: 
1) The 'inherent' fluctuation of 

the cerebrospinal fluid (CSF) 

2) The motility of the central ner­

vous system (CNS) 
3) The 'reciprocal tension mem­

brane' (RTM) - this is formed from 

the dural meninges folding and join­

ing to form the falx cerebri, tentorium 

cerebelli and falx cerebelli. 
4) The mobility of the cranial 

bones. 
5) The mobility of the sacrum be­

tween the iliac bones. He proposed 

that there was a direct link between 

the occiput and the sacrum via the 

spinal meninges. Motion in this sys­

tem was proposed to be transmitted 

throughout the body by fascial or 

fluid continuity. 
This was a model for the time and 

environment in which he lived. 

Recent Advances 
In more recent years, research and 

theory have hi~hlighted the roles of 

muscles, joint and nerves in the 

functionoftheneuro-musculoskeletal 

system (NMS). The NMS has been 

described as the primary machinery 
4 

of life as it is how we move and 

communicate and is the body's main 

energy consumer. The visceral and 

homeostatic systems are seen as 

supportive to the NMS and the sym­

pathetic part of the autonomic ner­

vous system as the principal mediator 

between the two. 
Thus modem osteopathy is no 

longer simply bone orientated, rather 

it includes the assessment of the whole 

NMS, its compensations and prob-
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lems, 
from a dy­

namic functional viewpoint. Muscu­

lar hypertonia, segmental dysfunc­

tion and somato-visceral facilitation 

are now more frequent diagnoses than 

a 'bone out of place'. 

We can now review cranial oste­

opathy in a modem light; indeed it is 

essential to do so for it to make any 

further progress. 

A New Perspective 
The first two of Sutherlands 'es­

sential' elements are irrelevant to an 

understanding of cranial osteopathy. 

It is finally becoming acknowledged 

that the amount of CSF produced per 

minute is too small a quantity to have 

any mechanical effect, and that the 

CNS does not have the contractile 

elements nortensile strength to move 

itself - and certainly not the whole 

craniumnortherestofthebody.
5 
Any 

movement of the CSF or change in 

shape of the CNS will be secondary to 

movement in the NMS or blood cir­

culatory system ( cranial blood flow is 

approximate! y two thousand times 

greater than the flow of CSF). All 

motion in the body is a result of mus­

cular action be it striated, smooth or 

cardiac. 
There is not a school of 'hepato­

splenic' osteopathy yet here are two 

structures with an 'inherent' circula­

tion of fluids, a connective tissue 

skeleton and are linked by the dia-

A AAO Journal 



Cranial Osteopathy: 
A New Perspective 

by Andrew Ferguson, DO (Hons) MRO 

Summary: The theory of cranial os­
teopathy has notkeptupwithimprov­
ing understanding in related areas. A 
viewpoint is put forward that begins 
to provide a remedy for that and also 
provides a foundation for progress 
towards a more comprehensive and 
holistic therapy. 
Key Words: Cranium, Bones, 
Sutures.Muscles, Wholebody,Emo­
tions. 

Introduction 
Cranial ( or cranio-sacral osteopathy 

was developed fifty years ago by 
l 

William Sutherland; since that time 
it has made little academic progress. 
Clinical results have justified a prac­
tice based on inaccurate theory and 
the time has come not just for a step 
forward, but for a fundamental change 
of perspective. For osteopathy to de­
velop and continue its role as guiding 
the way to the next higher stage of 

2 
medicine, we need to have an inte-
grated and evolving philosophy and 
theory based on secure foundations 
of anatomy and physiology. 

Historical Development 
Sutherland evolved his view at a 

time when osteopathy was a combi­
nation of the analysis of bone me­
chanics (thus the prefix 'osteo') and 
religious fervour: A. T. Still, the 
founder of osteopathy, was both a 
methodist minister and engineer as 
well as a physician. Sutherland ob­
served that the cranium was formed 
from many individual bones and spent 
many years analyzing their articular 
mechanics. This was indeed a great 
advance. He felt that the bones moved 
rhythmically and proposed a theory 
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to explain this which contained five 
essential elements: 

1) The 'inherent' fluctuation of 
the cerebrospinal fluid (CSF) 

2) The motility of the central ner­
vous system (CNS) 

3) The 'reciprocal tension mem­
brane' (RTM) - this is formed from 
the dural meninges folding and join­
ing to form the falx cerebri, tentorium 
cerebelli and falx cerebelli. 

4) The mobility of the cranial 
bones. 

5) The mobility of the sacrum be­
tween the iliac bones. He proposed 
that there was a direct link between 
the occiput and the sacrum via the 
spinal meninges. Motion in this sys­
tem was proposed to be transmitted 
throughout the body by fascia! or 
fluid continuity. 

This was a model for the time and 
enviromnent in which he lived. 

Recent Advances 
In more recent years, research and 

theory have hi~hlighted the roles of 
muscles, joint and nerves in the 
functionoftheneuro-musculoskeletal 
system (NMS). The NMS has been 
described as the primary machinery 

4 
of life as it is how we move and 
communicate and is the body's main 
energy consumer. The visceral and 
homeostatic systems are seen as 
supportive to the NMS and the sym­
pathetic part of the autonomic ner­
vous system as the principal mediator 
between the two. 

Thus modem osteopathy is no 
longer simply bone orientated, rather 
it includes the assessment of the whole 
NMS, its compensations and prob-
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lems, 
from a dy­

namic functional viewpoint. Muscu­
lar hypertonia, segmental dysfunc­
tion and somato-visceral facilitation 
are now more frequent diagnoses than 
a 'bone out of place'. 

We can now review cranial oste­
opathy in a modem light; indeed it is 
essential to do so for it to make any 
further progress. 

A New Perspective 
The first two of Sutherlands 'es­

sential' elements are irrelevant to an 
understanding of cranial osteopathy. 
It is finally becoming acknowledged 
that the amount of CSF produced per 
minute is too small a quantity to have 
any mechanical effect, and that the 
CNS does not have the contractile 
elements nor tensile strength to move 
itself - and certainly not the whole 
craniumnortherestofthebody.

5 
Any 

movement of the CSF or change in 
shape of the CNS will be secondary to 
movement in the NMS or blood cir­
culatory system (cranial blood flow is 
approximately two thousand times 
greater than the flow of CSF). All 
motion in the body is a result of mus­
cular action be it striated, smooth or 
cardiac. 

There is not a school of 'hepato­
splenic' osteopathy yet here are two 
structures with an 'inherent' circula­
tion of fluids, a connective tissue 
skeleton and are linked by the dia-
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phragm and peritoneum - perhaps 
we should start one! Why should the 
CNS be a special case? The fifth 
element, the mobility of the sacrum 
between the iliac bones, is also irrel­
evant to cranial function (except via 
muscular tension patterns) as the dural 
membranous link between the sacrum 
and occiput must have considerable 
slack, otherwise we would not be able 

6 
to move our spines at all. It could not 
transmit minute movements from one 
to the other. The third and fourth 
elements are important advances in 
our understanding of physiology, es­
pecially if we combine them with a 
study of the related musculature. The 
study of a complex bone and mem­
brane mechanism similar to the cra­
nium,suchastheelbow/forearm/wrist 
area, does yield some information in 
the absence of the muscles, but to 
understand its dysfunctions, we need 
to 'flesh out the bones' with muscles. 
How could 'tennis elbow' be ex­
plained without considering the 
muscles? The cranium should be 
looked at in the same way, no more 
mysteriously than the rest of the body. 

The Cranial Sutures 
Perhaps the main area of conten­

tion for this whole area of study is the 
movement of cranial bones relative to 
each other at the sutural junctions. It 
is widely accepted that the cranial 
bones are separate in childhood and 
the sutures, which are the sites of 
most of the growth of the cranium, 
become more formed as the individual 
ages. But do they fuse? 

Research has been done recent) y 
that demonstrates that the sutures have 
complex connective tissue structure~ 
including blood vessels and nerves 
and are clearly designed to allow 
movement, however small the range. 
There is agreement on the fusion of 
some junctions, such as the spheno­
basilar synchondrosis by about the 
age of 25, and some of the vault 
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sutures in later life. There is little 
research published on the large 
number of complex joints between 
the many bones of the facial area; the 
fact that there are so many articula­
tions in this area suggests that it is an 
area designed for movement. Func­
tionally this would make sense in 
view of the need for sinus drainage 
(maxillary, frontal ethmoidal, sphe­
noidal), eye drainage (lacrimal ducts), 
middle ear drainage ( eustacian tubes), 
maintaining clear nasal passages and 
shock absorption during mastication. 
The face also has the most muscles 
attached to it. Skeptics of the possi­
bility of sutural motion should answer 
the question 'Why do they not fuse?' 
as structure and function have evolved 
together to an advanced level in hu­
man beings. 

The arrangement of the dural me­
ninges to form the 'reciprocal tension 
membrane' makes more sense when 
one considers the cranium from birth, 
when the cranial vault is akin to a 
membranous bag with some plates or 
bone separated by fontanelles. A 
spherical structure inevitably needs a 
3-dimensional internal support. As 
the main directions of motion allowed 
by the sutures (although their orien­
tation would originally have been 
directed by motion demands) appears 
to be a narrowing/lengthening ( called 
'extension')

9 
alternating with a short­

ening/broadening (called 'flexion'). 
The membranes are orientated to limit 
the movement the falx cerebri limits 
'extension' and the tentorium cer­
ebelli limits 'flexion' - and as they 
are joined together in the middle of 
the cranium they could reasonably be 
called a 'reciprocal tension mem­
brane'. 

Sutherland and his followers 
placed great emphasis on motion at 
the spheno-basila sychondrosis al­
though, as already noted, this fuses by 
about the age of 25. Examination of 
any adult skull will show that it fuses 
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quite strongly, thus any study of the 
articular mechanics of an adult skull 
must assume that the sphenoid-occi­
put is one strong fused unit forming 
the base of the cranium. This means 
that a fundamental change of per­
spective is necessary from the classi­
cal view-thatofan 'internally driven' 
system where spheno-occipital mo­
tion moves the other bones - to an 
externally driven system where 
muscles attached to the cranium move 
the other bones relative to a solid 
spheno-occipital cranial base. This 
cranial base is itself mobile and held 
in a position of dynamic balance on 
top of the cervical spine by the many 
muscles and tissues of the neck. Prior 
to fusion, limited movement between 
sphenoid and occiput remains a pos­
sibility; functionally there is a dis­
tinction between muscles attached to 
the occiput, which are surrounded by 
the prevertebral fascia, and those at­
tached to the sphenoid, amongst which 

10 
is the pretracheal fascia. 

Cranial Musculature 
These can broadly be divided into 

the muscles solely attached to the 
cranium itself and those attached to 
the cranium and elsewhere. The first 
group includes the powerful muscles 
of mastication (temporalis, masseter 
and the pterygoids), the muscles of 
the scalp (occipitofrontalis) and the 
muscles of the face (orbicularis oris 
etc.). The second group includes the 
suprahyoid and pharyngeal muscles 
as well as the many powerful ante­
rior, lateral and posterior cervical 
muscles (e.g., trapezius, stemoclei­
domastoid, longus capitis, sernispi­
nalis capJ_\bS and the suboccipital 
muscles). 

How the function and dysfunction 
in vivo of the cranium can be con­
sidered without these muscles is hard 
to conceive. The great proportion of 
diagnosis and treatment related to the 
cranium islikelyto be almost entirely 
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directed towards these muscles, even 
if the practitioner thinks he or she is 
moving the bones or CSF. 

The muscles at the top of the neck, 
particularly the suboccipital muscles, 
have a significant sensory input to the 
vestibular centres in addition to the 
usual proprioceptive inputs, thus re­
laxation of these muscles can have 
widespread effects. This is probably 
the basis of what Sutherland called 
the CV 4 ( compression of the fourth 
ventricle). As he did not consider the 
muscles and the importance of their 
neurological input and reflexes, he 
had to find some explanation for the 
effects that he observed. Actually 
being able to compress the fourth 
ventricle by finger pressure on the 
muscles is not very likely! 

Whole Body Concepts 
The cranium does of course func­

tion as a part of the body as a whole. 
Division of the body into discrete 
areas is helpful from a functional point 
of view. In fact, itis actually ahinder­
ance, as it means that links and causes 
are overlooked and problems incor­
rectly or only partially diagnosed and 
treated. 

The body as a whole shows pat­
terns of tension/relaxation, strength/ 
weakness, bind/ease and integration/ 
loss of awareness. These are indi­
vidual, often complex and superim­
posed, and are reflected throughout 
the whole body including the cra­
nium. It is also dynamic. There is 
constant movement or tone in inner­
vated muscles, even when patterns 
feel fixed or repetitive. The patterns 
of tension also 'tend to show different 
qualities atdifferentdepths; the more 
superficial muscles tend to respond to 
more transient tensions, the deeper 
ones to longer standing or deeper 
rooted postures and attitudes. These 
are like individual somatic 'person­
alities'. 

The cranium is important in that it 
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is one of the potential areas for 'trans­
verse bind' ( along with the diaphragm, 
pelvis and possibly the thoracic in­
let), thus fixed tightness in this area 
can have an effect on the dynamics of 
the body as a whole. We take for 
granted, yet often overlook in our 
diagnosis, the deep asymmetries and 
patterns of tension that everybody 
has - for example one side of the head 
being narrower (extended), the same 
with the thorax and pelvis, the leg 
longer on the same side, the muscles 
harder to relax and the side being 
more vulnerable to trauma and able to 
recover less easily from it. The body 
has important levels of functional or­
ganization longitudinally as well as 
segmentally; we should always con­
sider both. 

It is also important to remember 
the complete functional integration 
of the NMS and visceral systems via 
the automomic nervous system. Al­
terations in blood circulation at a cap­
illary level under the influence of the 
sympathetic nervous system contrib­
utes to some effects of somatic dys­
function, and of its treatment, and 
may be relevant to some fluctuating 
fluid changes in the body. 

The Cranial Rhythm 
A pillar of the classical approach 

to cranial osteopathy has been the 
existence of a rhythmic movement of 
approximately ten cycles per minute. 
This is felt throughout the body and is 
independent of heart beat or breath­
ing. This has been thought of as being 
caused by the movement of the CSF 
and CNS but, as stated above, this 
concept now has little credibility. 
Further the rhythm appears to occur 
throughout the body at the same time. 
There is no delay from head to toe as 
might be expected ifit were caused by 
fluid pressure or fascial drag. Fascial 
or connective tissue transmission 
would also be affected by the position 
of the body or limbs, which is not the 
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case. The movement must be coordi­
nated by the nervous system and in­
volve muscles, as they are the only 
structures that cause any movement. 
Research evidence tends to support 
this view rather than the classical 
view(despiteclaimstothecontrary!). 
If muscles are denervated, the rhythm 
in the region is said to be approxi­
mately 20-30 cycles per minute

11 

suggesting that it is the innervated 
muscles that are responsible for the 
'normal' rhythm. 

The argument against the impor­
tance of muscles, i.e., that quadriple­
gics appear to have a normal rhythm 
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in their cranium, overlooks the fact 
that the most powerful cranial muscles 
- those of mastication - are innervated 
by the trigeminal and facial nerves, 
thus would be unaffected by cervical 
cord lesions. 

But does this rhythm exist? Ex­
periments designed to prove it does 
seem to do otherwise. In an experi­
ment to measure motion of the pari­
etal bones in the squirrel monkey'it 
was found that the parietal bones did 
move, but that they did so indepen­
dently of each other, which is incon­
sistent with a 'centrally driven' fluid 
model. Further 'proof in this ex­
periment (when the parietal move­
ment was found to be altered by 
flexing and extending the body of the 
monkey) was claimed to be due to this 
altering the CSF pressure, overlook­
ing any mechanical effects or neuro­
muscular reflexes. In all, the evidence 
points to the conclusion that an inde­
pendent rhythm does not exist, or ifit 
does, it is more random and related to 
individual muscles or patterns of 
function than being totally synchro­
nous throughout the body all the time. 
When a practitioner tunes into the 
'cranial rhythm' of a patient in an 
empathetic manner, there is an inter­
action between the two at a subcon­
scious or reflex level so that they both 
move at the same rate. We could not 
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directed towards these muscles, even is one of the potential areas for 'trans- case. The movement must be coordi- otherwise make sense of the many The Importance of Cranial the next step? The answer is to inte-
if the practitioner thinks he or she is verse bind' ( along with the diaphragm, nated by the nervous system and in- and varied movements that do occur. Osteopathy grate this with mind and emotions. 
moving the bones or CSP. pelvis and possibly the thoracic in- volve muscles, as they are the only This explains why two or more There are two aspects associated Only then can we claim to have a 

The muscles at the top of the neck, let), thus fixed tightness in this area structures that cause any movement. people can synchronize their per- with cranial osteopathy that are sepa- holistic perspective. 
particularly the suboccipitalmuscles, can have an effect on the dynamics of Research evidence tends to support ceived rhythms within seconds and rate but tend to be linked together. There is increasing evidence to 
have a significant sensory inputto the the body as a whole. We take for this view rather than the classical why different practitioners, palpating The first is the treatment of the era- support many links between psyche 
vestibular centres in addition to the granted, yet often overlook in our view (despite claims to the contrary!). the same patients a few minutes apart, nium, the second is the use of slow and soma at different levels of func-
usual proprioceptive inputs, thus re- diagnosis, the deep asymmetries and If muscles aredenervated, the rhythm usually get differing results when they and gentle techniques in diagnosis tion. Emotional factors can affect 
laxation of these muscles can have patterns of tension that everybody in the region is said to be approxi- count the rate of the rhythm. and treatment. skeletal muscle tension, alimentary 
widespread effects. This is probably has - for example one side of the head mately 20-30 cycles per minute

11 
This is not to say that palpating When the treatment of the era- function, the immune system

14 
hor-

the basis of what Sutherland called being narrower (extended), the same suggesting that it is the innervated 
ii 

this movement is useless. It does pro- nium is included within the osteo-it monal balance and the heart and 
the CV4 (compression of the fourth with the thorax and pelvis, the leg muscles that are responsible for the vide information as to the quality, pathic approach many areas of poten- many other areas - in fact, every area 
ventricle). As he did not consider the longer on the same side, the muscles 'normal' rhythm. ease, direction and vitality of muscu- tial benefit are opened up. Children of human function. Mind and body 
muscles and the importance of their harder to relax and the side being The argument against the impor- lar function. This means that experi- especially are likely to benefit as their are inseparable. They are one, a whole 
neurological input and reflexes, he more vulnerable to trauma and able to tance of muscles, i.e., that quadriple- ments to measure the reproducibility cranium is more mobile and has which is greater than the sum of it's 
had to find some explanation for the recover Jess easily from it. The body gics appear to have a normal rhythm of craniosacral findings 

12 
will come greater potential to change. Problems parts. The only possible weak divid-

effects that he observed. Actually has important levels of functional or- in their cranium, 
11 

overlooks the fact out better than chance, especially if that are likely to respond well are ing line could be drawn between the 
being able to compress the fourth ganization longitudinally as well as that the most powerful cranialmuscles the experiments work together often those associated with mechanical or conscious intellectual and subcon-
ventricle by finger pressure on the segmentally; we should always con- -those of mastication- are innervated and have a similar attitude and ap- drainage problems such as chronic scious emotional levels. The latter is 
muscles is not very likely! sider both. by the trigeminal and facial nerves, proach to the interaction with their otitis media(' glue ear') and the effects so integrated with the body that we 

It is also important to remember thus would be unaffected by cervical subjects. Assessment of this 'rhythm of cranial trauma (including birth). sometimes don't know what we are 

Whole Body Concepts the complete functional integration cord lesions. of interaction' between patient and Effects on behavior, learning and feeling emotionally until we experi-

The cranium does of course func- of the NMS and visceral systems via But does this rhythm exist? Ex- practitioner can provide qualitative sleeping are likely through any relax- ence our own body reacting (e.g., 

tion as a part of the body as a whole. the automomic nervous system. Al- periments designed to prove it does information which may be reasonably ing and reassuring contact, comfort flushing with embarrassment/anger). 

Division of the body into discrete terations in blood circulation at a cap- seem to do otherwise. In an experi- consistent and useful for any given or massage throughout the body - not An emotion needs to be felt, not 

areasishelpfulfromafunctionalpoint illary level under the influence of the ment to measure motion of the pari- practitioner, but is not in any way an just the cranium (though relaxing the thought. Interestingly, people who 

of view. In fact, itis actually ahinder- sympathetic nervous system contrib- eta! bones in the squirrel monkey 
7 
it objective rate that can be used for cranium muscles does feel particularly suppress or bottle their feelings tend 

ance, as it means that links and causes utes to some effects of somatic dys- was found that the parietal bones did comparisons between practitioners. good!). In adults problems such as to develop rigid deeper muscular pat-

are overlooked and problems incor- function, and of its treatment, and move, but that they did so indepen- 'Still points', where the movement in headache, facial pain and sinustitis terns, perhaps so that they can't feel 

rectly or only partially diagnosed and may be relevant to some fluctuating dently of each other, which is incon- a local or wide area (sometimes the can be helped by direct treatment to their own reactions. 

treated. fluid changes in the body. sistent with a 'centrally driven' fluid whole body) is felt to cease or balance the cranium in addition to the neck. This opens up new areas for oste-

The body as a whole shows pat- model. Further 'proof' in this ex- temporarily then resume in an altered The use of slow and gentle techniques opathy which are exciting and poten-

terns of tension/relaxation, strength/ The Cranial Rhythm periment (when the parietal move- pattern (which is usually a betterone), in diagnosis and treatment is not ex- tially of great therapeutic value, yet at 

weakness, bind/ease and integration/ A pillar of the classical approach ment was found to be altered by can be thought of as being a time elusive to the cranial approach, but is the same time the prospect may ap-

Joss of awareness. These are indi- to cranial osteopathy has been the flexing and extending the body of the when the complex choreography of a valuable part of it." Working in an pear daunting and confusing as we 

victual, often complex and superim- existence of a rhythmic movement of monkey) was claimed to be due to this neuronal function, with its billions of empathetic and functional manner can venture into areas that seem less ob-

posed, and are reflected throughout approximately ten cycles per minute. altering the CSP pressure, overlook- synaptic interactions occurring each influenceneuro-muscularpattems and jective. Yet are not a lot of our find-

the whole body including the era- This is felt throughout the body and is ing any mechanical effects or neuro- second, resets the proprioceptive pat- reflexes, just as more vigorous tech- ings very subject in any case - from 

nium. It is also dynamic. There is independent of heart beat or breath- muscular reflexes. In all, the evidence terning on input and output. A re- niques such as massaging and high- the simple assessment of the mobility 

constant movement or tone in inner- ing. Thishasbeenthoughtofasbeing points to the conclusion that an inde- petitive or fixed pattern, or bind, in velocity manipulation can. It is es- of and tension around the Jumbo-

vated muscles, even when patterns caused by the movement of the CSP pendent rhythm does not exist, or if it muscular-proprioceptive functioning peciall y useful in treating problems sacral junction to the motion of the 

feel fixed or repetitive. The patterns and CNS but, as stated above, this does, it is more random and related to needs careful, skilled and empathetic over a wide area, or when the muscles cranium? 

of tension also·tend to show different concept now has little credibility. individual muscles or patterns of il containing or balancing of key vari- are hard to get at directly such as the Good practitioners or therapists of 

qualities at different depths; the more Further the rhythm appears to occur function than being totally synchro- if ables of tension and distortion in or- diaphragm, psoas, pelvic floor, phar- any school or medical approach have 

superficial muscles tend to respond to throughout the body at the same time. nous throughout the body all the time. derforthe aberrantinputto be quieted ynx and upper and anterior cervial always learned to use the emotional 

more transient tensions, the deeper There is no delay from head to toe as When a practitioner tunes into the - the proprioceptive 'noise' to cease muscles. side of their interaction with patients, 

ones to longer standing or deeper might be expected if it were caused by 'cranial rhythm' of a patient in an for a moment - together with stilling however unintentionally. In working 

rooted postures and attitudes. These fluid pressure or fascia! drag. Fascia! empathetic manner, there is an inter- of the output (one of the principal Further Development primarily via the body, osteopaths 

are like individual somatic 'person- or connective tissue transmission action between the two at a subcon- effectsofwhichisonmuscularlength Having progressed from a bony have many advantages over many 

alities'. would also be affected by the position scious or reflex level so that they both and tone) before change can occur. model to an integrated whole body types of psychotherapists who have 

The cranium is important in that it of the body or limbs, which is not the move at the same rate. We could not view of structure and function what is to rely largely on verbal information, 

Winter 1991 14 J.11.. AAO Journal A AAO Journal Winter 1991 
15 



which can be far removed from the 
patients feelings. How much more 

potential osteopathy has in the more 

chronic, complex or severe patients if 

emotional factors are included in the 
evolving 'diagnosis' - which at this 

level cannot be simply a 'labeling' 
• 15 

exercise. 
In time we will evolve a language 

and understanding that includes both 

physical and mental meanings at the 

same time; it is notable that many 

words orphra~es are already ambigu­

ous, one or the other, or - more use­

fully - both. Examples are tension, 

release, attitude, posture, relaxation, 

fatigue, integrated, shock, holding on, 

etc. 
Awareness of emotional factors 

and the whole person will also help to 

diminish the depersonalization that is 

common criticism of many medical 

practitioners, yet is practiced by many 

other therapies including cranial os­

teopathy with its treatment of the 

'mechanism' (Sutherland called his 

view of cranial function the 'primary 

respiratory mechanism' 
1
) as opposed 

to the whole individual. 

Conclusion 
I trust that osteopaths who adhere 

to the classical view of cranial oste­

opathy will have their illusions shat­

tered, but I hope that this paper will 

stimulate a change of perspective that 

will prove interesting and rewarding. 

There are still a lot of unanswered and 

unasked questions. It is important that 

the foundations on which we base our 

ideas are solid so that we can securely 

build up our understanding before 

venturing into unexplored areas. With 

credibleideas, wecanhavemeaning­

ful discussions with practitioners and 

theoreticians of other disciplines and 

with fellow osteopaths who disagree 

with some of Sutherland's concept. 

Both Still and Sutherland would be 

pleased with progress; the former 

considered that he had grasped the 
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proverbial tail of an osteopathic 
'squirrel in the hole of the tree' and 

the latter, that he had in addition, a 
. 1 

breech presentauon; perhaps we may 

now be grasping the lumbar spine! In 

practical clinical terms, most 'cra­

nial' osteopaths can carry on doing 

much the same things as they have 

been doing, just think about and ex­

plain them different! y. 
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Letter to 
A.T. Still 

Dear Doctor Still, 
The other day I was reading once 

again 'The Lengthening Shadow of 
Doctor Andrew Taylor Still" that won­
derful book written by your student and 
long time friend, Arthur G. Hildreth, 
DO. On page 277 I came across a 
passage that I thought was very inter­
esting. Doctor Hildreth said about you: 
"He often said that of all the discoveries 
of the nineteenth century, osteopathy 
would, in time, offerto women the field 
of greatest usefulness. He always said 
that women ... should be even better 
doctors than men." This was because 
you felt that women in general had 
skills and abilities which gave them 
almost a natural ability to be excellent 
physicians. 

We know that there were women as 
osteopathic students and practitioners 
from theearliestdays of the profession, 
and we know that you always believed 
in equality for women and welcomed 
them to your school and to the osteo­
pathic profession. I thought you might 
like to know what progress women 
have made as osteopathic physicians 
since the earlier days of the profession. 

According to statistics recently re­
leased by the AOA, there are nearly 
5000 women osteopathic physicians. 
The percentage of women in osteo­
pathic medical schools since 1968 has 
increased at an annual rate of 17%. 
Right now there are a little over 2000 
women em oiled in osteopathic medical 
schools, accounting for almost 33% of 
the total emollment. This year, the AAO 
Educational Program at the AOA Con­
vention was dedicated to women's 
health issues, with a faculty made up 
entirely of women. 

Having women be part of the pro­
fession from the very beginning is an­
other example of your wisdom and 
foresight. I thought you would be 
pleased to know that women are and 
always will be an important part of the 
osteopathic profession. 

Your ongoing student, 
Raymond J. Hruby, DO, F AAO 

A AAO Journal 



which can be far removed from the 
patients feelings. How much more 
potential osteopathy has in the more 
chronic, complex or severe patients if 
emotional factors are included in the 
evolving 'diagnosis' - which at this 
level cannot be simply a 'labeling' 

. 15 
exercise. 

In time we will evolve a language 
and understanding that includes both 
physical and mental meanings at the 
same time; it is notable that many 
words or phra~es are already am bigu­
ous, one or the other, or - more use­
fully - both. Examples are tension, 
release, attitude, posture, relaxation, 
fatigue, integrated, shock, holding on, 
etc. 

Awareness of emotional factors 
and the whole person will also help to 
diminish the depersonalization that is 
common criticism of many medical 
practitioners, yetis practiced by many 
other therapies including cranial os­
teopathy with its treatment of the 
'mechanism' (Sutherland called his 
view of cranial function the 'primary 
respiratory mechanism '

1
) as opposed 

to the whole individual. 

Conclusion 
I trust that osteopaths who adhere 

to the classical view of cranial oste­
opathy will have their illusions shat­
tered, but I hope that this paper will 
stimulate a change of perspective that 
will prove interesting and rewarding. 
There are still alotofunanswered and 
unasked questions. Itis important that 
the foundations on which we base our 
ideas are solid so that we can securely 
build up our understanding before 
venturing into unexplored areas. With 
credible ideas, we can have meaning­
ful discussions with practitioners and 
theoreticians of other disciplines and 
with fellow osteopaths who disagree 
with some of Sutherland's concept. 
Both Still and Sutherland would be 
pleased with progress; the former 
considered that he had grasped the 
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proverbial tail of an osteopathic 
'squirrel in the hole of the tree' and 
the latter, that he had in addition, a 
breech presentation; 

1 
perhaps we may 

now be grasping the lumbar spine! In 
practical clinical terms, most 'cra­
nial' osteopaths can carry on doing 
much the same things as they have 
been doing, just think about and ex­
plain them differently. 
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Marketing 

Using OMT: Will the 
Students Lead the Charge? 

At the SOMA meeting held Sunday, 
November 4 in New Orleans, over 170 
students heard the Jones Group presen­
tation "Marketing the Osteopathic Ad­
vantage." Prior to the seminar, Laurie 
Jones asked the students what topics 
they wished to brainstorm after the pre­
sentation. The two topics they were most 
interested in were: (1) Getting OMT 
into 3rd and 4th year rotations and (2) 
How to find (and get) existing DOs who 
use and promote OMT in their practices. 

Following are excerpts/quotes pre­
sented by each table discussion group 
leader following the brainstorming ses­
sion. They have been grouped here into 
categories for easier reading. 

• Rotations 
- For ten years, evaluations showed 

students were not using enough OMT. 
- UCSFhas mandatory OMT in rota­

tions. House of Delegates voted down 
mandatory OMT. 

- Why was OMT in 3rd and 4th year 
rotations voted down by the Board of 
Governors? 

- Some schools don't have rotations 
usingOMT. 

• Time/financial factors 
- Physicians are busy seeing 40-50 

patients per day - OMT becomes diffi­
cult; no time. 

- MaybeDOsdon'tdoOMTbecause 
we don't get reimbursed for it. Do we? 

- 90% of students' effort go towards 
basic sciences. We don't have enough 
time to learn OMT. 

- Financial - takes more time 
- We choose to be DOs. We should 

make time for treatments. 

• Education 
- It is human nature to use something 

that has proven benefit. Our allopathic 
bosses and colleagues don't understand 
it. 

- WeneedmoreeducationaboutOMT 
so we can be more comfortable using it. 

- Education starts athome. We should 
be unafraid to speak about it. 
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- We mostly learn that the best treat­
ment for everything is drugs. 

- Institutions across the couutry don't 
even know what to call OMT. What is 
OMT? 

- Arethereprograrnswecanget CME 
credits for to learn about OMT? 

- What are the practical aspects of 
OMT? 

Mary Theodorus, DO and member of 
the Board of Trustees for the AOA, 
clarifiedthattheAOAcanootmakerules 
for colleges. However, she advised, stu­
dents need to demand thatOMTbecome 
a major agenda item for AACOM. 

Student: We do not have enough 
people to teach OMT. 

Dr. Theodorus: Contact the physician 
in the hospital that is using OMT. 

• Training 
- We don't get enough exposure to 

OMT in 3rd and 4th years. 
- Ask that hospitals allow 3-4 year 

students to do OMT. 
- We need more emphasis on differ­

ent OMT techniques. 
- Attending physicians should dem­

onstrate O MT with theory. 
- We need to get specialists to teach 

us and promote it more. 
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Problems/Misconceptions 
- Wedon'tknowhowtogettheexist­

ing DOs to do OMT. 
- Touch the patients? Our doctors 

won't even let us touch their charts! 
- We are laughed at if we mention 

OMT. 
- Many DOs don't have confidence 

in how to use OMT. 
- Why should students do structural 

exams if they are in fear about using 
OMT. 

• Pride/Motivation/Marketing 
- Using OMT is our responsibility. 
- We should ask for teachers on O MT, 

practice on our family if we must to see 
the results and go to Academy convoca­
tions. 

- We'rebettertrainedthanMDs.Let's 
use what we know. 

- Patients will return to you once they 
have had OMT treatments. 

- It's great to see this much motiva­
tion. We must get and stay self moti­
vated. 

- We need speakers on OMT. 
- We need to see and hear from more 

physicians who are using OMT in their 
practice. 

- We need to get more marketing in 
usingOMT. 

I 

/ 
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Let's Return to the Basics 
Dr. Andrew Taylor Still was very 

aware of the need for change in the 
healthcare system of his time. He 
experienced the loss of three of his 
children to meningitis and was un­
successful in his efforts to save them. 
As a result of that experience he be­
gan to develop a new approach to 
treating disease. His intent was not to 
start a new profession but to improve 
the existing one. However, unable to 
effect change in his M.D. colleagues, 
he felt compelled to start a new pro­
fession. This he did ninety-nine years 
ago. 

I often think of a cartoon that had 
a positive effectonmy attitude toward 
life. Picture in your minds eye a 
shabbily dressed bum sitting on a 
curb with his feet in the gutter. Pass­
ing by in a chauffeur driven limousine 
is an obviously successful man. The 
caption underthe cartoon read, 'There 
but for me, go I." 

Question: Are we in the health 
care professions in that situation to­
day? Are we responsible for our 
problems? 

Nobody needs to be told that our 
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health care system today is passing 
through a time of crisis and yet, as 
much as anything else, that system is 
suffering from a confusion of words; 
from the inflamed rhetoric that fans 
discontent and seeks only to destroy; 
from bland and inflated rhetoric that 
excuses without persuading. 

The American people today seek 
new leadership within the health care 
system. They long to hear a calm 
voice. 

More than anything else, the 
American people are searching for 
leaders who can restore the old values 
of health care while developing new 
systems for its delivery. 

The challenge for new leadership 
then, is the challenge for a voice that 
forgoes rhetoric and political slogans 
and replaces them with wisdom, 
common sense and understanding. 
We, the members of the osteopathic 
profession, can supply that voice. We 
can provide the American people with 
the new leadership it so desperately 
seeks. 

Supplying that voice, providing 
that new leadership, is our summons 
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to greatness. How we will respond to 
that summons is what I want to talk 
about today. 

Our profession, by standing above 
the political battlefield, has demon­
strated to the American people that it 
seeks only to improve the public health 
through service. Through its dedica­
tion to classical ideals, the profession 
has shown that healthcare can become 
more scientific, butitneed notlose its 
humanity. Through its willingness to 
serve in areas of umnet need, the 
profession has demonstrated that 
service, not personal or professional 
ambition, guides and motivates its 
programs. 

It has been said that most ailing 
organizations have developed a func­
tional blindness to their own defects. 
They are not suffering because they 
cannot solve their problems, but be­
cause they will not see their prob­
lems. They can look straight at their 
faults and rationalize them as virtues 
or necessities. 

It might seem at first that these 
words do not apply to our ailing health 
care system. Certain! y there is no 
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shortage of experts who see the prob­
lems and are offering solutions. But I 
believe itis fair to say that many of the 
experts are guided by a basic and 
erroneous assumption ... the assump­
tion that America's health care crisis 
is a crisis of material things and that 
solving that crisis simply requires a 
greater abundance and more even 
distribution of material things. 

Let us examine that assumption. 
There is no doubt that our health care 
system is riddled with shortages, 
shortages which must be relieved if 
America is to reach its goal of com­
prehensive health care for all citizens. 
We must find ways to recruit and train 
greater numbers of professional and 
allied health workers. We must build 
moreoutpatientclinics,neighborhood 
health centers and extended care fa­
cilities. 

We must make certain that where 
a person lives, whether in rural Iowa 
orin the heart of the city ghetto, does 
not affect his ability to receive health 
care. We must find ways to reduce the 
spiraling costs ofhealth care, broaden 
insurance coverage and prevent un­
wanted illness from depriving people 
of the dignity that comes with paying 
their own way. 

All these things and more must be 
done and we must dedicate ourselves 
to their accomplishment. 

But none of these things, or all of 
them, will solve the crisis since it is 
not one of material things alone. There 
is also a crisis of the spirit, a crisis of 
forgotten ideals. 

The Bible says, "What is a man 
profited if he gain the whole world 
and lose his own soul?" And we might 
ask, "How will America profit from a 
health care system that worships sci­
ence, technology and efficiency if it 
ignores basic humanity?" 

I note earlier that the American 
people are seeking a return to the old 
values of health care. While they are 
applauding the advancements of 
medical science with all their drama 
and gadgetry, they are becomingmore 
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and more dissatisfied because too 
many physicians seem to have for­
gotten some simple things ... some 
basic things .. .in dealing with people. 

The growing public demand for 
family physicians reflects this feeling. 
What people are seeking is not the 
old, kindly doctor who made house 
calls in the middle of the night and 
accepted a few ears of com in payment. 
They are not seeking that person, but 
the ideals he reflected, the spirit in 
which he rendered service. 

They seek one person, one fellow 
human being, to whom they can con­
fide all their health problems. They 
seek a person who listens and who 
cares. They seek a person who places 
dedication to service above monetary 
gain. They seek a person who under­
stands, with sympathy, the terrible 
forces that tear at the human spirit. 
They seek a person that can help put 
that spirit back together again. They 
seek a counselor and guide. They 
seek a friend. 

The crisis in American health care 
is a crisis of the spirit because these 
ideals are being forgotten. Too often, 
efficiency replaces kindness, tech­
nology replaces sympathy, special­
ization replaces holistic care, and 
human decency is sacrificed on the 
altar of progress. 

The task before us, then, is to re­
kindle those high ideals of dedication 
and service and humanity into the 
health care system. We must look 
within ourselves, listen to those better 
angels of our nature and once again 
dedicate ourselves to basic things ... 
goodness, decency, love, kindness and 
service. We must understand and ac­
cept the need for change, in ourselves 
and in our health care system, and not 
rant against it with rhetoric or slogans. 

Asthecartooncaptionsaid, ''There 
but for me, go I." If we will do these 
things, if we will recognize and find 
answers to this great crisis of the 
spirit, we will demonstrate to the 
American people that the osteopathic 
profession is the new leader they seek! 
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Health Care & Education Leaders Call for 
Major Reform in Health Professional Education 

by Pew Health Professions Commission, Duke University Medical Center 

Washington, D.C. -A group of 

prominent health care experts, edu­

cators, corporate and govermnent 

leaders called for major changes in 

the way health care professionals are 

educated if they are to meet the 

nation's health care needs in the years 

ahead. 
In its first report, "Healthy 

America: Practitioners for 2005", the 

27-member Pew Health Professions 

Commission outlines a two-fold 

"Agenda for Action" for U.S. health 

professional schools. The first part 

defines 17 "competencies" - skills, 

attitudes and values - that must be­

come part of what future health care 

providers learn if they are to practice 

effectively in a drastically changed 

health care environment. The second 

is a series ofinstitutional and curricu­

lar changes required to take place in 

health professional schools that will 

ensure that practitioners possess these 

competencies to help them meet 

changing health care needs and prac­

tice more effectively. 
The need for these changes in 

health professional education was 

reinforced by a recent Louis Harris 

and Associates survey of health care 

practitioners which indicates large 

numbers of practitioners rate major 

elements of their training in these 

areas as only "fair or poor." 

Competencies for 2005 
The proposed professional com­

petencies reflect a projected shift in 

the U.S. health care system from the 

provision of individual treatment and 

care to one that puts increased em­

phasis on overall population health. 

Health professional schools must as-
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sist practitioners for 2005 learn to: 
• care for the community's health 
through an understanding of such 
health determinants as the environ­
ment, socioeconomic conditions, be­
havior, medical care and genetics; 
• ensure cost-effective and appro­
priate care, balancing cost and quality 
in the decision making process; as­
sess and use increasingly complex 
and costly technology when it is ap­
propriate; 
, promote healthy lifestyles and help 
individuals, families and entire com­
munities adopt and maintain healthy 
behavior; 
, participate in coordinated care as 
team members in organized settings 
that emphasize high quality, cost-ef­
fective integrated services and activi­
ties that promote, protect and im­
prove health; 
• participate in a racially and cultur­
ally diverse society, understanding 
health status and health care through 
differing cultural values; and 
• continue to learn, anticipate 
changes in health care and respond by 
redefining and maintaining profes­
sional competency throughout prac­

tice life. 
"By the year 2005, an estimated 

1.3 million health professional stu­
dents will graduate and enter the health 

care system. As practitioners, they 
will require different skills to meet 

primary health care needs," said Ed­
ward H. 0 'Neil, assistant dean at Duke 

University Medical Center and ex­
ecutive director of the Pew Commis­
sion. "These practitioners are enter­

ing the educational system now. The 

time to initiate these changes is now." 

Strategies for Change 
The second part of the Pew 

Commission's action agenda calls for 
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coordinated, multilevel acts to facili­

tate change in health professional 

education. Among the strategies ad­
vocated by the Pew Commission: 
• schools must assess the compe­
tencies demanded of their graduates 
and redefine their educational core 
including disciplines taught, educa­
tional settings and the teaching learn­
ing process; 
• schools must restructure them­
selves to redefine the clinical curricu­
lum core by re-examining their mis­
sion, the health of their particular 
communities, their organizational 
structure, faculty and reward incen­
tives and the cost of health profes­
sional education; 
• universities should foster innova­
tion in their health professional 
schools by selecting leaders capable 
of forgingnewvisions, providing clear 
direction, furnishing flexibility in 
governance and administrative poli­
cies so schools can respond to chang­
ing needs, recognizing that different 
types of health professional schools 
are necessary; 
• health professional associations 
should facilitate professional redefi­
nition through leadership, education 
and licensure and accreditation; 
• govermnentshouldsupportchange 
in health professional education 
through financial incentives, accredi­
tation policies and licensure regula­
tions, innovative health manpower 
utilization, and increased access to 
care; and 
• individual consumers, community 
and special interest groups should 
participate in the redefinition of the 
professions by demanding responsive 
providers, participating in debate of 
health care issues, becoming better 
informed about choice and purchase 
of services and supporting the well­

ness philosophy. 
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prominent health care experts, edu­
cators, corporate and government 
leaders called for major changes in 
the way health care professionals are 
educated if they are to meet the 
nation's health care needs in the years 
ahead. 

In its first report, "Healthy 
America: Practitioners for2005", the 
27-member Pew Health Professions 
Commission outlines a two-fold 
"Agenda for Action" for U.S. health 
professional schools. The first part 
defines 17 "competencies" - skills, 
attitudes and values - that must be­
come part of what future health care 
providers learn if they are to practice 
effectively in a drastically changed 
health care environment The second 
is a series of institutional and curricu­
lar changes required to take place in 
health professional schools that will 
ensure that practitioners possess these 
competencies to help them meet 
changing health care needs and prac­
tice more effectively. 

The need for these changes in 
health professional education was 
reinforced by a recent Louis Harris 
and Associates survey of health care 
practitioners which indicates large 
numbers of practitioners rate major 
elements of their training in these 
areas as only "fair or poor." 

Competencies for 2005 
The proposed professional com­

petencies reflect a projected shift in 
the U.S. health care system from the 
provision of individual treatment and 
care to one that puts increased em­
phasis on overall population health. 
Health professional schools must as-
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sist practitioners for 2005 learn to: 
• care for the community's health 
through an understanding of such 
health determinants as the environ­
ment, socioeconomic conditions, be­
havior, medical care and genetics; 
• ensure cost-effective and appro­
priate care, balancing cost and quality 
in the decision making process; as­
sess and use increasingly complex 
and costly technology when it is ap­
propriate; 
• promote healthy lifestyles and help 
individuals, families and entire com­
munities adopt and maintain healthy 
behavior; 
• participate in coordinated care as 
team members in organized settings 
that emphasize high quality, cost-ef­
fective integrated services and activi­
ties that promote, protect and im­
prove health; 
• participate in a racially and cultur­
ally diverse society, understanding 
health status and health care through 
differing cultural values; and 
• continue to learn, anticipate 
changes in health care and respond by 
redefining and maintaining profes­
sional competency throughout prac­
tice life. 

"By the year 2005, an estimated 
1.3 million health professional stu­
dents will graduate and enter the health 
care system. As practitioners, they 
will require different skills to meet 
primary health care needs," said Ed­
ward H. 0 'Neil, assistant dean at Duke 
University Medical Center and ex­
ecutive director of the Pew Commis­
sion. "These practitioners are enter­
ing the educational system now. The 
time to initiate these changes is now." 

Strategies for Change 
The second part of the Pew 

Commission's action agenda calls for 
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coordinated, multilevel acts to facili­
tate change in health professional 
education. Among the strategies ad­
vocated by the Pew Commission: 
• schools must assess the compe­
tencies demanded of their graduates 
and redefine their educational core 
including disciplines taught, educa­
tional settings and the teaching learn­
ing process; 
• schools must restructure them­
selves to redefine the clinical curricu­
lum core by re-examining their mis­
sion, the health of their particular 
communities, their organizational 
structure, faculty and reward incen­
tives and the cost of health profes­
sional education; 
• universities should foster innova­
tion in their health professional 
schools by selecting leaders capable 
of forging new visions, providing clear 
direction, furnishing flexibility in 
governance and administrative poli­
cies so schools can respond to chang­
ing needs, recognizing that different 
types of health professional schools 
are necessary; 
• health professional associations 
should facilitate professional redefi­
nition through leadership, education 
and licensure and accreditation; 
• governmentshouldsupportchange 
in health professional education 
through financial incentives, accredi­
tation policies and licensure regula­
tions, innovative health manpower 
utilization, and increased access to 
care; and 
• individual consumers, community 
and special interest groups should 
participate in the redefinition of the 
professions by demanding responsive 
providers, participating in debate of 
health care issues, becoming better 
informed about choice and purchase 
of services and supporting the well­
ness philosophy. 
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Harris Survey Results 
Findings from a Harris national 

telephone survey of practicing den­
tists, nurses, pharmacists, physicians 
and veterinarians indicate that many 
practitioners rate theirtraining as "fair 
or poor" in the following critical 
areas: 
• factoring cost implications of 
treatment into decision-making; 
• responding to increasing levels of 
public, government and insurers' in­
volvement in and scrutiny of the health 
care system; 
• understanding the social determi­
nants of health in the community; 
• evaluating the appropriate use of 
costly and complex technology; 
• understanding and responding to 
the community's cultural diversity; 
• ensuring access to good health care 
for all segments of the population. 

One out of two practitioners sur­
veyed consider it "very important" to 
receive such training. 

"The fact that 44% of physicians 
in the survey believe that their medical 
schools did only a fair or a poor job of 
teaching them how to respond to the 
needs of diverse cultural or ethnic 
groups is a disturbing finding in light 
of this country's demographic real­
ity," said William C. Richardson, 
president of The Johns Hopkins Uni­
versity and Pew Commission co­
chairman. "Andmorethanonehalfof 
the physicians felt their schools did 
only a fair or a poor job in teaching 
them how to evaluate the appropri­
ateness of complex and costly tech­
nology. These data provide a clear 
indication that society will benefit 
from physicians and other health care 
providers receiving additional types 
of educational experiences beyond 
those they are now getting in the 
nation's health professional schools." 

Next Steps for the Pew CoffillmSion 
The Pew Health Professions 

Commission is now assisting the 
nation's schools of allied health, den-
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tistry, medicine, nursing, pharmacy, 
public health and veterinary medi­
cine to develop missions and programs 
that are more responsive to the 
changing health care needs of the 
U.S. population. 

During the next decade, the 
Commission will: 
• develop appropriate policy rec­

ommendations for federal, state, pro­
fessional and institutional agencies 
that will support the attainment of the 
Commission's agenda; 
• communicate the agenda, recom­

mendations and the need for reform 
in health professional education to 
professional schools, universities, 
professional associations, government 
and the public; 
• create an ongoing forum for the 

discussion of issues, a clearinghouse 
for information and a center for advo­
cacy for change within the health 
professional schools; and 
• invest in targeted demonstration 

projects that reflect the national 
agenda at the health professional 
school and college levels. 

The Pew Health Professions 
Commission is an initiative of The 
Pew Charitable Trusts, administered 
through the Duke University Medical 
Center. The Pew Charitable Trusts, a 
national philanthropy based in Phila­
delphia, support nonprofit activities 
in the areas of conservation and the 
environment, culture, education, 
health and human services, public 
policy, and religion. Through their 
grantmaking, the Trusts seek to en­
courage individual development and 
personal achievement, cross-disci­
plinary problem solving and innova­
tive, practical approaches to meet the 
changing needs of society. 

The Second Annual "Application of 
Osteopalhic Concepts & Clinical 
Medicine and Board Review" will 
be held October 1-4, 1992 at Walt 
Disney World, Orlando, FL 
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In Memory of 
Neil A. Pruzzo, DO 

After 15-1/2 years of osteopathic 
medical practice, Neil A. Pruzzo, DO, 
of Richardson,Texas passed away 
Monday morning, September 9. He was 
49. Services were held September 11 at 
the Kingdom Hall of Jehovahs Wit­
nesses in Carrollton,Texas with inter­
ment in Restland Memorial Park. 

BomSeptember25, 1941 in Marion, 
Ohio, Dr. Pruzzo attended Salpointe 
High School in Arizona. He then at­
tended Midwest University and South­
western State, both in Oklahoma. After 
receiving his DO degree in 1973 from 
the Kansas City College of Osteopathic 
Medicine, he spent an additional year 
in the fellowship program of Osteo­
pathic Principles and Practice. He was 
in solo practice of rehabilitative osteo­
pathic medicine in Richardson. 

An active member of TOMA since 
1973, Dr. Pruzzo was a speaker at nu­
merous TOMA conventions. He was a 
member of TOMA District V, AOA, 
The American Academy of Osteopa­
thy, Texas Academy of Osteopathy, 
past president of the Cranial Academy, 
founding member of the American 
College of Sports Medicine andfaculty 
member of TCOM. Dr. Pruzzo was a 
member of the Carrollton congregation 
of Jehovahs Witnesses. 

Survivors include wife, Judith 
Pruzzo; two daughters, Maria C. Rich­
ards and Lisa M. Pruzzo; two sons, Eric 
Alan and Brian S. Pruzzo; his father, 
Samuel F. P. Pruzzo; and one brother, 
Raymond L. Pruzzo. 

The family requests that memorials 
be made to the Cranial Academy, 1140 
West 81h Street, Meridian,ID 83642, c/o 
Madeline Rathjen. 

The AAO Journal extends deepest 
sympathy to lhe family members and 
many friends of Dr. Pruzzo. 
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Case History 

A Disease Which No 
Longer Exists 

About a year ago, a patient by the 

name of Mary Smith (not her real 

name) came to consult with me about 

her father who was in a Veteran's 

Hospital in another city suffering se­

verely with 'shingles' which treat­

ment had failed to alleviate. In fact, 

she said, her father's condition had 

been getting worse for the past five 

weeks in spite of the treatment which 

the specialists had been administer­

ing. She was noticeably anxious about 

his condition and asked ifl would see 

him. 
On October 19, 1990 she brought 

herfathertomyoffice. We'll call him 

Jack Smith. Jack was a 74 year old 

male weighing l 80pounds, obviously 

in pain and very depressed. He said 

that for many months he had been 

having a lot of fatigue and vague 

disturbances of the bowels and sore­

ness of the mouth and tongue. About 

five weeks ago, he started having 

eruption of skin sores on the neck, 

upper back, face and inhis mouth. His 

mouth got so sore that he couldn't eat 

after awhile and he tried to live on soft 

foods and liquids. He had lost about 

twenty pounds during the past several 

weeks. He said that he had been to the 

VA hospital and had been seen by 

several doctors who had done exten­

sive laboratory work and other tests 

he couldn't remember, and finally 

told him he had 'shingles'. Jack said 

that the treatment hadn't helped and 

that the sores on his skin and in his 

mouth were getting worse and the 

pain was becoming unbearable. 
At the time I saw him he was 

takingerthromycin500mgfourtimes 

a day, prednisone 5 mg daily (the 

dose had been much higher to start 

with) and tylenol with codeine to help 
eliminate the pain. 
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by Harlan 0. L. Wright, DO, Lubbock, Texas 

Examination of this patient re­

vealed the following: 
A large framed man, obviously 

emaciated and wrinkled, in pain and 

very depressed. BP 110/80. Pulse 108 

and regular. Abdomen was generally 

tender, heart and lungs fairly normal. 

No edema. Mouth revealed large sores 

on mucous membrane and gums. (He 

had not been able to wear his dentures 

for several weeks.) Gums and mu­

cous membrane of mouth were se­

verely inflamed. Conjunctiva of eyes 

was injected and inflamed. Tongue 

was severely fissured and a beefy red 

color with obvious deterioration of 

the taste buds. The skin of the neck, 

face and left ear displayed large 

weeping sores. Jack was very weak. 

Structural examination revealed sev­

eral upper rib lesions and some upper 

cervical bony lesions (which were of 

secondary importance at this time). 

I felt the diagnosis in this case to 

be quite obvious. It could hardly be 

herpes zoster (shingles), as had been 

diagnosed, because the skin lesions 

and pain did not follow definite nerve 

segment patterns. The more logical 

diagnosis in Jack's case had to be the 

disease which modem medicine re­

fuses to admit exists-PELLAGRA, 

accompanied by various other nutri­

tional deficiencies. 
The treatment was quite simple 

and effective. He was immediately 

given an intravenous infusion of or­

thomolecular doses of Vitamin B 

complex, 25,000 mg of ascorbic acid, 

1000 mg of calcium gluconate, 400 

mg of magnesium chloride and 4 mg 

of zinc. This was administered in250 

cc of ringers lactate at the rate of 

approximately one drop per second. 

Oral supplementation was given 

daily as follows: A multiple vitamin 
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and mineral tablet containing 75 mg 

of all the "B" factors, niacinamide 

1500 mg (the RDA is 40 mg), Vita­

min C 3000 mg, and 24 brewer's 
yeast tablets. 

Progress was as follows (taken 

from clinical records): 
10/22 (3 days after first visit) Skin 

lesions healing rapidly. Scaling skin 

flaking off. Mouth and mucous mem­

brane much less inflamed. Another 

intravenous infusion was given. 

10/25 Continued rapid improve­

ment. Sores on the neck are 90% gone 

and mouth pain much less. Taking 

fewer pain pills. Another IV infusion 

given. 
11/1 Patient feeling much much 

better. Color of tongue and mouth 

almost normal now. No mouth sores. 

Patient is eating well now. Almost 

pain free. IV push of B complex to­

day. PTR 2 weeks. 
11/15 Patient doing "great". Only 

slight discomfort of facial neuralgia 

present. Skin lesions all cleared. Con­

tinue vitamins at home but reduce 

Vitamin C to 2000 mg and niaci­

namide to 500 mg. (Patient was al­

ready back to 183 lbs. from a low of 

176 lbs.) 
After this last visit, Jack went to 

visit his sister in ;mother state. When 

he returned the following March he 

came to see me for some back pains 

unrelated to his pellagra. We fixed 

these with osteopathic manipulation. 

He stated that he had been completely 

free of any symptoms of his pellagra 

since his last visit to the office and 

that he was continuing to take his 

vitamins and follow his diet free of 

refined sugar and white flour foods, 

with plenty of fresh fruits and veg­

etables. 
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10/22 (3 days after first visit) Skin 
lesions healing rapidly. Scaling skin 
flaking off. Mouth and mucous mem­
brane much less inflamed. Another 
intravenous infusion was given. 

10/25 Continued rapid improve­
ment. Sores on the neck are 90% gone 
and mouth pain much less. Taking 
fewer pain pills. Another IV infusion 
given. 

11/1 Patient feeling much much 
better. Color of tongue and mouth 
almost normal now. No mouth sores. 
Patient is eating well now. Almost 
pain free. IV push of B complex to­
day. PTR 2 weeks. 

11/15 Patient doing "great". Only 
slight discomfort of facial neuralgia 
present. Skin lesions all cleared. Con­
tinue vitamins at home but reduce 
Vitamin C to 2000 mg and niaci­
namide to 500 mg. (Patient was al­
ready back to I 83 lbs. from a low of 
176 lbs.) 

After this last visit, Jack went to 
visit his sister in another state. When 
he returned the following March he 
came to see me for some back pains 
unrelated to his pellagra. We fixed 
these with osteopathic manipulation. 
He stated that he had been complete! y 
free of any symptoms of his pellagra 
since his last visit to the office and 
that he was continuing to take his 
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Comment 
As unusual as this case seems, it is 

not at all unusual-just a little farther 
advanced and easier to recognize than 
the cases of nutritional deficiencies 
that come into the office daily dis­
guised with a myriad of different di­
agnoses. 

When the Father of Osteopathy, 
A. T. Still, established the 'rule of the 
artery' about 125 years ago, our foods 
weremuchmore complete, unrefined, 
nutritious and unpolluted than they 
are today. The blood that reached the 
diseased tissue with structural cor­
rection had more healing power than 
it does today. I am sure that were he 
alive today, he would be the first to 
extol the value of nutritional therapy 
in connection with corrective ma­
nipulation of the body structure. 

ANESTHESIOLOGY 
INTERN~ MEDICI,,~ 

l'M@ii 
Medicare/Medicaid News 

by Don Self, Medical Consultants 

CPTs ARE NOT GOING AWAY 
At conventions, we had numerous 

people comment that CPT codes will 
not be here in 1992, or they would 
change all of the descriptions. The 
CPT codes will probably be with us 
until around 1996 or 1997, when they 
will probably be replaced by ICD-9 
Procedure Codes (to conform to 
hospital procedure coding). In 1992, 
we expect the CPT descriptions for 
visits to change to conform to the new 
five level system, as part of PPR and 
Data Standardization. We do not ex­
pect major changes in procedures, 
tests or surgeries. 

FAMILY PRACTICE 
08/GYN}, 

EVALUATING OUTSIDE X-RAYS 
Occasionally, patients may bring 

you x-rays taken by another physi­
cian to evaluate. CPT code 76140-26 
(consult on x-ray exam made else­
where, written report) covers this 
evaluation and report for private 
carriers. The charge is not based on 
the number of x-rays examined and 
should be a flat rate. Noting your 
findings on the medical record will 
meet the "written report" requirement. 
Fees nationally average $50 to $72 
for this procedure code. Medicare 
carriers expect you to bill for the 
appropriate x-ray code (chest, spine, 
etc.), using the 26 modifier. If the 
claim is denied due to duplication 
(which may happen), you should re­
quest a review, per Medicare. 
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ROUTINE CHOLESTEROL 
TESTING 

Many patients are starting to re­
quest cholesterol testing routinely, 
without the physician ordering the 
test. This is considered preventative 
medicine and is not approved by 
Medicare. Therefore if a patient re­
quests (or sometimes demands) a 
cholesterol test, you should notify the 
patient the test will not be covered by 
Medicare and the patient should sign 
a statement acknowledging that you 
informed them of the non-covered 
status and the reason it is non-cov­
ered. The reason this signed statement 
is needed, is because the test is some­
times covered by Medicare (when 
medically necessary, prescribed by 
the physician and indicated) and 
therefore Medicare requires the state­
ment to be signed. 
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Excerpt from the UAAO Environmental 
Centennial Campaign Proposal 

The osteopathic approach to any problem seeks to apply the following rationale: 

• the body is a unit 
• the body has self-healing, self-regulating mechanisms 

• structure and function are inter-related. 

An osteopathic approach to environmental issues would therefore consider the following 

elements: 
• the earth is a self-contained unit; factors which affect one part affect all parts; each family unit, 

indeed each individual is important to the whole; all sub-units must have adequate waste removal 

and function responsibly within the surrounding environment 

• the earth is capable of cleansing itself within limits; biologic mechanisms have evolved to handle 

many natural waste products; care must be taken not to overwhelm self-healing, self-regulating 

mechanisms; and 
• choices concerning the way we live and the products that we use are important in the waste 

products that we accumulate; the structure of materials we choose to use in daily living is as 

important in the ability of the earth to process waste products as the manner in which we dispose 

of these wastes. 

Winter 1991 

VISCOELASTIC VISCOPLASTIC 
AXES OF MOTION IN THE 

CRANIUM 

This outstanding video presentation with 
Carlisle Holland, D.O. explains the 
physics and biochemistry underlying the 
gentle and effective technique of 
Cranio-sacral Osteopathy. 
State-of-the-art computer animations 
en hance this fascinating and 
thought-provoking sixty minute tape, 
making a complex subject 
understandable for anyone using this 
technique in the treatment of children 
a nd adults. 

To order, send your check for $125.00 
(PAL format $140.00) with your name 
and address to: 

24 

Video Medicine Labs 
14435 N. 7th Street, Suite 300 

Moon Valley, AZ 85022 

Brochure of other video presentations 
available upon request. 
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Osteopathic Medicine Encounters 
A Decade of Growth 

Asian and female students led the 
surge of enrollments in osteopathic 
medical colleges-a rise of 37%, 
during the past 10 years, reports the 
American Association of Colleges of 
Osteopathic Medicine (AACOM). 
Overall enrollments at the nation's 15 
colleges of osteopathic medicine have 
swelled to an all time high of 6,792 
students in 1990-91, according to 
AACOM's 1991 Annual Statistical 
Report. Moreover, applicants for the 
entering class of 1991 increased by an 
estimated 22% over 1990. 

The number of Asian freshmen 
rose 35% in 1990 and under-repre­
sented minority freshmen (Blacks, 
Native Americans and Hispanics) 
increased by more than 5%. Female 
freshmen students now account for 
more than 34% of first year enroll­
ment. "These numbers are gratifying 
to all ofus in the osteopathic medical 
profession," said Philip Pumerantz, 
PhD, AACOM board chairman and 
president of the College of Osteo­
pathic Medicine of the Pacific in 
Pomona, California. "Behind the 
numbers," he said, "lies the unspoken 
dedication of many competent and 
caring future osteopathic physicians.'' 

WANTED Osteopathic physician to 
join a well-established practice lo­
cated in mid-Manhattan, which spe­
cializes in musculoskeletal medicine. 
This is an excellent opportunity to 
join a growing practice that has been 
well established for 12 years. Please 
forward resume and C.V. to: Gary L 
Ostrow, D.O., 115 East 61st. Street, 
New York, N.Y. 10021 

The report also reflects the chang­
ing nature of medical education 
showing that some newer curriculum 
areas are receiving increasing atten­
tion. The study of doctor/patient re­
lationships is by far the winner. 
clocking up a 400% increase in the 
number of classroom hours over the 
decade. Geriatrics ranked second. The 
study of alcohol/drug abuse preven­
tion and treatment claimed the high­
est number of students in training, 
while hours devoted to cost contain­
ment and occupational/environmental 
health are on the rise as well. 

The AACOM report also outlines 
sources of scholarships and grants, as 
well as average student debt loans. 
Additionally it highlights college 
expenditures, revenues and research 
grants, plus faculty and student char­
acteristics. 

AACOM's 1991 Annual Statistical 
Report is available for $12 from AA­
COM, an organization founded in 1897 
to foster the advancement of osteopathic 
medical colleges. Its offices are located at 
6110 Executive Boulevard, Suite 405, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. Copies of 
the related report "Debts and Career Plans 
of Osteopathic Medical Students" are also 
available at $9. 

Locum tenens needed for OMT 
practice. N. Dallas. Judith Pruzzo 
214-231-7482 or 931-8760 

FOR SALE/LEASE 
OMT practice for sale/lease. Newly 
remodeled. IBM computerized billing. 
Staffed. N. Dallas suburb. Judith Pruzw 
214-231-7482 or 931-87(,(). 

Advertising policy: The purpose of the classified advertising section of The AAO Journal is to provide 
a forum for communication within the osteopathic community across the nation. The publishers of The 
AAO Journal make no claims or warranties for the products or services advertised in The AAO Journal. 
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J. Scott HeaJherington, D.O., president of the Ameri­
can Academy of Osteopathy presents the 1991 TL. 
Northup Lecturer Award to Robert Kappler, D .O. 

Thank You!!! 
We wish to thank those doctors who 

helped with the Structural Consultation 
and Treatment Service during the 1991 
Annual American Osteopathic Associa­
tion Convention in New Orleans. 

Thirty-nine (39) doctors offered their 
services and 168 registered treatments 
were given. 

Thanks to the following doctors: John 
E. Balmer, Jr., DO; Mason B. Barney, 
DO; Alan R. Becker, DO, FAAO; An­
drew H. Berry, DO; Stephen D. Blood, 
DO, FAAO; Boyd R. Buser, DO; James 
A. Carlson, DO; Anthony G. Chila, DO, 
FAAO; Guy AA. DeFeo, DO; Brian De­
genhardt, DO; Nate DeLisi, DO; Donald 
D. Downing, DO FAAO; Kenneth E. 
Dye, DO; Robert WW. England, DO, 
F AAO; Patricia Enzman, DO; Louis 
Hasbrouck, DO; David Heilig, DO, 
FAAO; Jan T. Hendryx, DO; VicLOr C. 
Hoefner,Jr.,DO,FAAO;LonA.Hoover, 
DO; Robert E. Irvin, DO; Wiliam L. 
Johnston,DO,FAAO;JohnM.Jones,III, 
DO; RobertE. Kappler, DO, FAAO; Ken 
Klak, DO; Brian Knight, DO; William A. 
Kuchera, DO, F AAO; J ohannaLeuchter, 
DO; David Little, DO; Paul S. Miller, 
DO; Lloyd W. Morey, Jr., DO, FAAO; 
DAvid A. Patriquin, DO, FAAO; Regi­
nald Platt, DO; Ross E. Pope, DO; Karen 
Steele, DO; Cecil C. Thorpe, DO; J. 
Michael Wieting,00; Williaam E. Wyatt, 
DO; and Herbert A. Yates, DO, FAAO. 
Your efforts are greatly appreciated. 

Winter 1991 
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for more information, and look for your program in the mail 
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Let's 
Get Back 
To Our Roots: 
Come With Us 
to Kirksville 
Saturday, March 28, 1992 
• 'Join us as we return to our roots" 
• Learn little known facts about AT. Still; relive early medical practice & develop-

ments to the modern day. 
• Mix fellowship with education 
■ Visit the AT. Still museum 
■ See the 1st Osteopathic School house 
■ See the Birth Cabin of AT. Still 
■ Explore the new campus of The Kirksville College of Osteopathic Medicine 

We will take the train ride (just like early patients going to Kirksville) from Kansas 
City to LaPlata. Then hop on a bus for the short trip from LaPlata to Kirksville. 

■ Meet & talk with some of the great teachers from the past 
■ 6 hours of CME requested 
■ The fee schedule is as follows: 

Academy Members 
Spouses 
Excluding transportation 

Non-Academy members 
Spouses 
Excluding transportation 

Students 
Spouses 
Excluding transportation 

$135 
135 

70 
$150 
150 
80 

$100 
100 
35 

Prices include round-trip Amtrak ticket to 
LaPlata, bus transportation to Kirksville and 
back, lunch, tours, dinner and CME. 
Limited accommodations - advance registration required. 

~Ameriean 
Aeademy of 
Osteopathy 

1127 Mt. Vernon Road 
P.O. Box 750 
Newark, Ohio 43058-0750 
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